
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2002 No. 814

The National Assistance (Assessment of Resources)
(Amendment) (Wales) Regulations 2002

Amendment of the principal Regulations

2.—(1)  The principal Regulations shall be amended in accordance with the following paragraphs
of this regulation.

(2)  In regulation 20 (capital limit) for the figure “£18,500” there shall be substituted the figure
“£19,000”.

(3)  In regulation 28(1) (calculation of tariff income from capital) for the figure “£11,500”, where
it appears, there shall be substituted the figure “£11,750” and for the figure “£18,500” there shall
be substituted the figure “£19,000”.


