
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 770

The Environmental Offences (Fixed Penalties)
(Amendment) (England) Regulations 2023

Amendment of the Environmental Protection Act 1990

3.—(1)  The Environmental Protection Act 1990 is amended as follows.
(2)  In section 33ZA(9)(a), for “£400” substitute “£1000”.
(3)  In section 34ZA(8), for “£400” substitute “£600”.


