
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 535

The Rampion Offshore Wind Farm (Amendment) Order 2021

Amendment to Schedule 3 (footpath to be permanently stopped up)

6. Schedule 3 (footpath to be permanently stopped up) is amended as follows—
(a) in column (3) (Extent of stopping up)—

(i) for “453 metres” substitute “186 metres”;
(ii) for “vertical zebra stripes” substitute “black and white dashes”; and

(iii) for “A and E on the” substitute “A and B on the revised”;
(b) in column (4) (New footpath to be substituted)—

(i) for “736 metres” substitute “218 metres”;
(ii) for “black” substitute “solid orange”; and

(iii) for “A, B, C, D and E on the” substitute “A and B on the revised”.


