
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 731

The Employment Rights (Miscellaneous
Amendments) Regulations 2019

PART 4
INFORMATION AND CONSULTATION OF EMPLOYEES

Amendment of the Information and Consultation of Employees Regulations 2004

16.—(1)  The Information and Consultation of Employees Regulations 2004(1) are amended as
follows.

(2)  In regulation 5(3)(b) (entitlement to data) for “10%” substitute “2%”.
(3)  In regulation 7(2) and (3) (employee request to negotiate an agreement in respect of

information and consultation) for “10%”, in each place it occurs, substitute “2%”.

(1) S.I. 2004/3426, to which there are amendments not relevant to these Regulations.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/3426

