Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 1257

The Plant Health etc. (Miscellaneous Fees)
(England) (Amendment) Regulations 2019

Amendment of the Plant Health (Export Certification) (England) Order 2004
2.—(1) The Plant Health (Export Certification) (England) Order 2004(1) is amended as follows.
(2) In article 4—
(a) in paragraph (2)—
(1) in sub-paragraph (a)—
(aa) for “£250” substitute “£750”;
(bb) for the words from “column 3” to the end substitute “column 2 of that table”;

(i1) in sub-paragraph (b), for the words from “column 4” to the end substitute “column
3 of that table”;

(b) in paragraph (3), for “columns 3 and 4” substitute “columns 2 and 3”;
(c) in paragraph (4)—
(1) in sub-paragraph (a)—
(aa) for “£250” substitute “£750”;
(bb) for “£7.43” substitute “£7.88”;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£14.86” substitute “£15.76”.
(3) For Schedule 3 substitute—

“SCHEDULE 3 Article 4(1)

Fees for export certification services and pre-export services

(1) ) )

Service Fee (£) Fee (£)

Inspection of consignment 31.90 for each 15 minutes (or part 63.80 for each 15 minutes (or part
thereof), subject to a minimum fee thereof), subject to a minimum fee
0f 63.80 of 127.60

Audit of a grain inspection carried 13.20 for each 15 minutes (or part 26.40 for each 15 minutes (or part

out pursuant to article 3(3) thereof), subject to a minimum fee thereof), subject to a minimum fee
0f26.40 of 52.80

Laboratory examination 16.78 per sample tested 33.56 per sample tested

Issue of certificate 12.76 per certificate 25.52 per certificate

(1) S.I. 2004/1404; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 2015/382, 2018/286.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/1404
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/382
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/286

Document Generated: 2023-10-02
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(1) ) ()
Service Fee (£) Fee (£)
Amendment of a certificate at the 7.88 per certificate 15.76 per certificate”.

request of the exporter




