
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2018 No. 219

The Communications (Television
Licensing) (Amendment) Regulations 2018

Amendment of Schedule 1

4.—(1)  The Table in Schedule 1 (issue fees for TV licences) is amended as follows.
(2)  In the third column of the row relating to TV licence (black and white only) General Form

for “£49.50” substitute “£50.50”.
(3)  In the third column of the row relating to TV licence (including colour) General Form for

“£147.00” substitute “£150.50”.
(4)  In the third column of the row relating to TV licence (black and white only) Multiple Form

for “£49.50” substitute “£50.50”.
(5)  In the third column of the row relating to TV licence (including colour) Multiple Form for

“£147.00” substitute “£150.50”.


