
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 270

The Social Security (Fees Payable by Qualifying
Lenders) (Amendment) Regulations 2017

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Social Security (Fees Payable by Qualifying Lenders)
(Amendment) Regulations 2017 and come into force on 1st April 2017.

Amendment of the Social Security (Claims and Payments) Regulations 1987

2. In paragraph 7 of Schedule 9A to the Social Security (Claims and Payments) Regulations
1987(1) (fees payable by qualifying lenders), for “£0.44” substitute “£0.39”.

Amendment of the Universal Credit, Personal Independence Payment, Jobseeker’s
Allowance and Employment and Support Allowance (Claims and Payments) Regulations
2013

3. In paragraph 9(2) of Schedule 5 to the Universal Credit, Personal Independence Payment,
Jobseeker’s Allowance and Employment and Support Allowance (Claims and Payments)
Regulations 2013(2) (fees payable by qualifying lenders), for “£0.44” substitute “£0.39”.

Revocation of Regulations

4. The Regulations set out in the Schedule are revoked to the extent specified.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Work and Pensions

6th March 2017

Caroline Nokes
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State,

Department for Work and Pensions

(1) S.I. 1987/1968. Schedule 9A was inserted by S.I. 1992/1026. Paragraph 7 of Schedule 9A was amended by S.I. 2002/3197.
There have been numerous previous instruments amending the fee prescribed in paragraph 7 of Schedule 9A, the last of which
is S.I. 2016/228.

(2) S.I. 2013/380. There have been three previous instruments amending the fee prescribed in paragraph 9(2) of Schedule 5, the
last of which is S.I. 2016/228.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1987/1968
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/1026
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/3197
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/228
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/380
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/228

