
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 1314

The Town and Country Planning (Fees for Applications,
Deemed Applications, Requests and Site Visits)

(England) (Amendment) Regulations 2017

Amendments in relation to an increase in application fees

2.—(1)  The 2012 Regulations are amended as follows.
(2)  In regulation 11—

(a) in paragraph (3)(b) for “£195” substitute “£234”;
(b) in paragraph (6)(a) for “£385” substitute “£462”; and
(c) in paragraph (6)(b) for “£19,049” substitute “£22,859”, for “£115” substitute “£138” and

for “£250,000” substitute “£300,000”.
(3)  In regulation 15—

(a) in paragraph (4) for “£331” substitute “£397”; and
(b) in paragraph (5) for “£110” substitute “£132”.

(4)  In paragraph (1) of regulation 16—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£28” substitute “£34”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£97” substitute “£116”.

(5)  In regulation 17—
(a) the first provision is numbered as paragraph (1);
(b) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£28” substitute “£34”; and
(c) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£195” substitute “£234”.

(6)  In paragraph (2) of regulation 18, for “£195” substitute “£234”.
(7)  In Part 1 of Schedule 1—

(a) in paragraphs 3(1) and 4(2) for “£385” substitute “£462”;
(b) in paragraphs 5 and 6(b) for “£195” substitute “£234”;
(c) in paragraph 7(1)—

(i) in paragraph (a) for “£57” substitute “£68”;
(ii) in paragraph (b) for “£575” substitute “£690”;

(iii) in paragraph (c) for “£195” substitute “£234”; and
(d) in paragraph 14(2)—

(i) in paragraph (a) for “£385” substitute “£462”;
(ii) in paragraph (b) for “£9,527” substitute “£11,432”, for “£115” substitute “£138” and

for “£125,000” substitute “£150,000”.



Document Generated: 2023-05-22
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(8)  In Part 2 of Schedule 1 (scale of fees), in the “Fee Payable” column of the table, for any fee
of an amount specified in Column 1 of the table below, substitute the increased amount specified
in Column 2.

Column 1 – amount in £ specified in the scale
of fees table in Part 2 of Schedule 1 to the
2012 Regulations

Column 2 – increased amount

£80 £96

£115 £138

£126 £151

£172 £206

£195 £234

£214 £257

£339 £407

£385 £462

£423 £508

£1,690 £2,028

£2,150 £2,580

£9,527 £11,432

£19,049 £22,859

£29,112 £34,934

£31,725 £38,070

£32,100 £38,520

£65,000 £78,000

£125,000 £150,000

£250,000 £300,000

(9)  In Schedule 2 in the table, for “£110” in both places it occurs, substitute “£132” and for
“£385” substitute “£462”.

2


