
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2016 No. 402

The Civil Proceedings, Family Proceedings and
Upper Tribunal Fees (Amendment) Order 2016

Amendments to the Upper Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum Chamber) (Judicial Review)
(England and Wales) Fees Order 2011

4. In the table in Schedule 1 to the Upper Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum Chamber) (Judicial
Review) (England and Wales) Fees Order 2011(1) in column 2 (amount of fee)—

(a) for the entry corresponding to fee 2.1 (application on notice where no other fee is specified)
for “£80” substitute “£255”;

(b) for the entry corresponding to fee 2.2 (application by consent or without notice where no
other fee is specified) for “£45” substitute “£100”;

(c) for the entry corresponding to fee 2.3 (application for a summons or order for a witness
to attend the Tribunal) for “£40” substitute “£50”;

(d) for the entry corresponding to fee 3.1(a) (request for a copy of a document of 10 pages
or less) for “£5” substitute “£10”.

(e) for the entry corresponding to fee 3.2 (request for a copy of a document in electronic form)
for “£5” substitute “£10”.

(1) S.I. 2011/2344; to which there are amendments but none is relevant to this Order.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/2344

