
S T A T U T O R Y  I N S T R U M E N T S  

2015 No. 503 

SOCIAL SECURITY 

The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of 

Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2015 

Made - - - - 3rd March 2015 

Coming into force - - 1st April 2015 

The Secretary of State for Work and Pensions makes the following Regulations in exercise of the 

powers conferred by sections 1(1), (2) and (4) and 7(1) and (2) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. 

(Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979(a). 

In accordance with section 7(3)(b) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act 

1979, a draft of this instrument was laid before Parliament and approved by resolution of each 

House of Parliament. 

Citation, commencement and application 

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) 

(Payment of Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2015 and come into force on 1st April 2015. 

(2) These Regulations apply only in relation to any case in which a person first fulfils the 

conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) 

Act 1979 on or after 1st April 2015. 

 

Amendment of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims) 

Regulations 1988 

2.—(1) The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims) Regulations 

1988(c) are amended as follows. 

(2) In the proviso to regulation 5(1) (payment where death results from diffuse mesothelioma) 

for “£3,015” substitute “£3,051”. 

(3) In regulation 6(1)(a) (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by tuberculosis), for 

“£6,237” (in both places) substitute “£6,312”. 

(4) In regulation 8 (minimum amount payable to dependant) for “£3,015” substitute “£3,051”. 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) 1979 c. 41. Section 1 was amended by section 24 of the Social Security Act 1985 (c. 53).  
(b) Section 7(3) was amended by section 58 of the Welfare Reform Act 2007 (c. 5). 
(c) S.I. 1988/668. S.I. 1989/552 and S.I. 2014/869 are the relevant amending instruments. 



(5) For the Schedule to those Regulations, substitute— 

 

 “SCHEDULE Regulations 3, 4 and 6 

TABLE 1 

1 

This table is for the determination of payments to disabled persons under regulation 3 or 

regulation 6 and for the determination of payments to dependants of deceased sufferers 

under regulation 4(1). 

2 

The relevant period is the period specified in regulation 3(2) or, in the case of a disabled 

person to whom regulation 6 applies, the first period specified in regulation 6(1)(b). 

3 

(1) The age of the disabled person is their age determined in accordance with regulation 

3(2) or, in the case of a disabled person to whom regulation 6 applies, regulation 6(1)(b). 

 

(2) In determining the amount payable to a dependant of a disabled person under 

regulation 4(1), the age to be taken for the purpose of calculating the sum to be deducted 

from the amount which would have been payable to the disabled person had they still been 

alive, is the age of the deceased on their last birthday before their death. 

 

4 

The table prescribes payments to disabled persons to whom disablement benefits(a) are 

payable under section 108 of the Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992(b) or 

under any corresponding provision of the former Industrial Injuries Acts(c), or would be 

payable but for the disablement amounting to less than the appropriate percentage. 

 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) “disablement benefit” is defined in section 2(3) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979. 
(b) 1992 c. 4. 
(c) “the former Industrial Injuries Acts” is defined in section 2(3) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act 

1979. 



 

3 

A
g
e 

o
f 

d
is

a
b
le

d
 

p
er

so
n
 

P
er

ce
n
ta

g
e 

a
ss

es
sm

en
t 

fo
r 

th
e 

re
le

va
n
t 

p
er

io
d
 

 1
0
%

 

o
r 

u
n
d
er

 

£
 

1
1
%

 

-2
0
%

 

£
 

2
1
%

 

-3
0
%

 

£
 

3
1
%

 

-4
0
%

 

£
 

4
1
%

 

-5
0
%

 

£
 

5
1
%

 

-6
0
%

 

£
 

6
1
%

 

-7
0
%

 

£
 

7
1
%

 

-8
0
%

 

£
 

8
1
%

 

-9
0
%

 

£
 

9
1
%

 

-1
0
0
%

 

£
 

3
7
 a

n
d
 

u
n
d
er

 
3
5
,3

1
3
 

6
3
,0

6
4
 

7
3
,9

9
2
 

7
6
,0

9
6
 

7
8
,1

9
7
 

7
9
,8

7
8
 

8
1
,5

6
0
 

8
3
,2

4
3
 

8
4
,9

2
3
 

8
6
,6

0
7
 

3
8
 

3
4
,3

0
5
 

6
0
,5

3
9
 

7
1
,7

6
3
 

7
4
,3

3
2
 

7
6
,5

1
3
 

7
8
,1

9
7
 

7
9
,8

7
8
 

8
1
,5

6
0
 

8
3
,2

4
3
 

8
4
,9

2
3
 

3
9
 

3
3
,2

9
5
 

5
8
,0

1
6
 

6
9
,5

3
6
 

7
2
,5

6
3
 

7
4
,8

3
6
 

7
6
,2

9
2
 

7
8
,1

9
7
 

7
9
,8

7
8
 

8
1
,5

6
0
 

8
3
,2

4
3
 

4
0
 

3
2
,2

8
9
 

5
5
,4

9
1
 

6
7
,3

0
8
 

7
0
,7

9
5
 

7
3
,1

4
8
 

7
4
,8

3
4
 

7
6
,5

1
3
 

7
8
,1

9
7
 

7
9
,8

7
8
 

8
1
,5

6
2
 

4
1
 

3
1
,2

7
9
 

5
2
,9

7
2
 

6
5
,0

8
2
 

6
9
,0

2
6
 

7
1
,4

7
3
 

7
3
,1

4
8
 

7
4
,8

3
4
 

7
6
,5

1
3
 

7
8
,1

9
7
 

7
9
,8

7
8
 

4
2
 

3
0
,2

6
3
 

5
0
,4

5
2
 

6
2
,8

5
1
 

6
7
,2

7
0
 

6
9
,7

8
9
 

7
1
,4

7
3
 

7
3
,1

4
8
 

7
4
,8

3
4
 

7
6
,5

1
3
 

7
8
,1

9
7
 

4
3
 

2
8
,7

5
7
 

4
7
,5

0
5
 

6
0
,6

2
4
 

6
5
,9

2
2
 

6
8
,6

1
4
 

7
0
,6

3
3
 

7
2
,3

1
1
 

7
3
,9

9
2
 

7
5
,6

7
5
 

7
7
,3

5
8
 

4
4
 

2
7
,2

4
1
 

4
4
,5

6
3
 

5
8
,3

9
2
 

6
4
,5

7
8
 

6
7
,4

3
6
 

6
9
,7

8
9
 

7
1
,4

7
3
 

7
3
,1

4
8
 

7
4
,8

3
4
 

7
6
,5

1
3
 

4
5
 

2
5
,7

3
1
 

4
1
,6

2
1
 

5
6
,1

6
5
 

6
3
,2

3
0
 

6
6
,2

6
0
 

6
8
,9

4
5
 

7
0
,6

3
3
 

7
2
,3

1
1
 

7
3
,9

9
2
 

7
5
,6

7
5
 

4
6
 

2
4
,2

1
6
 

3
8
,6

8
0
 

5
3
,9

4
0
 

6
1
,8

8
7
 

6
5
,0

8
2
 

6
8
,1

1
0
 

6
9
,7

8
9
 

7
1
,4

7
3
 

7
3
,1

4
8
 

7
4
,8

3
4
 

4
7
 

2
2
,7

0
5
 

3
5
,7

3
5
 

5
1
,7

0
9
 

6
0
,5

3
9
 

6
3
,9

0
6
 

6
7
,2

7
0
 

6
8
,9

4
5
 

7
0
,6

3
3
 

7
2
,3

1
1
 

7
3
,9

9
2
 

4
8
 

2
1
,4

0
0
 

3
4
,5

5
8
 

4
9
,9

4
8
 

5
7
,8

5
0
 

6
1
,8

8
7
 

6
4
,9

0
9
 

6
6
,5

9
5
 

6
8
,2

7
6
 

6
9
,9

5
2
 

7
1
,6

4
2
 

4
9
 

2
0
,0

9
6
 

3
3
,3

8
1
 

4
8
,1

8
0
 

5
5
,1

5
8
 

5
9
,8

7
0
 

6
2
,5

5
6
 

6
4
,2

4
0
 

6
5
,9

2
2
 

6
7
,6

0
5
 

6
9
,2

8
8
 

5
0
 

1
8
,7

9
3
 

3
2
,2

0
5
 

4
6
,4

4
8
 

5
2
,4

6
9
 

5
7
,8

5
0
 

6
0
,2

0
2
 

6
1
,8

8
7
 

6
3
,5

6
6
 

6
5
,2

4
6
 

6
6
,9

3
0
 

5
1
 

1
7
,4

8
9
 

3
1
,0

2
7
 

4
4
,6

4
6
 

4
9
,7

7
6
 

5
5
,8

2
9
 

5
7
,8

5
0
 

5
9
,5

4
7
 

6
1
,2

0
9
 

6
2
,8

9
5
 

6
4
,5

7
8
 

5
2
 

1
6
,1

8
6
 

2
9
,8

4
9
 

4
2
,8

8
2
 

4
7
,0

8
5
 

5
3
,8

1
1
 

5
5
,4

9
1
 

5
7
,1

7
9
 

5
8
,8

5
8
 

6
0
,5

3
9
 

6
2
,2

1
8
 

5
3
 

1
4
,9

6
5
 

2
7
,7

5
0
 

4
0
,1

8
9
 

4
4
,7

3
3
 

5
1
,7

9
4
 

5
3
,8

1
1
 

5
5
,4

9
1
 

5
7
,1

7
9
 

5
8
,8

5
8
 

6
0
,5

3
9
 

5
4
 

1
3
,7

4
7
 

2
5
,6

4
8
 

3
7
,4

9
9
 

4
2
,3

8
3
 

4
9
,7

7
6
 

5
2
,1

3
4
 

5
3
,8

1
1
 

5
5
,4

9
1
 

5
7
,1

7
9
 

5
8
,8

5
8
 

5
5
 

1
2
,5

3
1
 

2
3
,5

4
6
 

3
4
,8

1
4
 

4
0
,0

2
2
 

4
7
,7

5
6
 

5
0
,4

5
2
 

5
2
,1

3
4
 

5
3
,8

1
1
 

5
5
,4

9
1
 

5
7
,1

7
9
 

5
6
 

1
1
,3

0
8
 

2
1
,4

4
1
 

3
2
,1

2
0
 

3
7
,6

7
0
 

4
5
,7

4
2
 

4
8
,7

6
6
 

5
0
,4

5
2
 

5
2
,1

3
4
 

5
3
,8

1
1
 

5
5
,4

9
1
 

5
7
 

1
0
,0

9
0
 

1
9
,3

3
7
 

2
9
,4

3
1
 

3
5
,3

1
3
 

4
3
,7

3
1
 

4
7
,0

8
6
 

4
8
,7

6
6
 

5
0
,4

5
2
 

5
2
,1

3
4
 

5
3
,8

1
1
 

5
8
 

9
,2

9
0
 

1
7
,5

7
4
 

2
6
,2

8
0
 

3
1
,6

9
5
 

3
9
,3

5
0
 

4
2
,4

6
3
 

4
4
,2

7
0
 

4
6
,0

3
9
 

4
7
,7

5
7
 

4
9
,4

4
0
 

5
9
 

8
,4

9
1
 

1
5
,8

0
6
 

2
3
,1

2
2
 

2
8
,0

8
5
 

3
4
,9

7
7
 

3
7
,8

3
6
 

3
9
,7

7
0
 

4
1
,6

2
1
 

4
3
,3

8
6
 

4
5
,0

6
5
 

6
0
 

7
,6

9
7
 

1
4
,0

4
0
 

1
9
,9

6
9
 

2
4
,4

6
7
 

3
0
,6

1
0
 

3
3
,2

1
4
 

3
5
,2

6
7
 

3
7
,2

0
8
 

3
9
,0

1
7
 

4
0
,6

9
9
 



 

4 

6
1
 

6
,8

9
3
 

1
2
,2

7
5
 

1
6
,8

1
9
 

2
0
,8

5
1
 

2
6
,2

3
4
 

2
8
,5

8
8
 

3
0
,7

7
2
 

3
2
,7

9
3
 

3
4
,6

4
3
 

3
6
,3

2
4
 

6
2
 

6
,0

9
5
 

1
0
,5

1
1
 

1
3
,6

6
4
 

1
7
,2

3
6
 

2
1
,8

6
2
 

2
3
,9

6
3
 

2
6
,2

8
0
 

2
8
,3

8
0
 

3
0
,2

6
3
 

3
1
,9

5
2
 

6
3
 

5
,6

7
5
 

9
,5

0
1
 

1
2
,2

7
5
 

1
5
,4

1
1
 

1
9
,4

4
8
 

2
1
,5

2
2
 

2
3
,7

1
2
 

2
5
,7

3
1
 

2
7
,5

7
7
 

2
9
,2

5
9
 

6
4
 

5
,2

6
4
 

8
,4

9
1
 

1
0
,8

8
8
 

1
3
,5

7
8
 

1
7
,0

2
5
 

1
9
,0

8
8
 

2
1
,1

4
9
 

2
3
,0

8
2
 

2
4
,8

8
5
 

2
6
,5

6
7
 

6
5
 

4
,8

3
6
 

7
,4

8
3
 

9
,5

0
1
 

1
1
,7

5
3
 

1
4
,6

1
2
 

1
6
,6

4
9
 

1
8
,5

8
2
 

2
0
,4

3
4
 

2
2
,2

0
0
 

2
3
,8

8
1
 

6
6
 

4
,4

1
7
 

6
,4

7
6
 

8
,1

1
3
 

9
,9

2
0
 

1
2
,1

9
4
 

1
4
,2

0
8
 

1
6
,0

1
8
 

1
7
,7

8
1
 

1
9
,5

0
8
 

2
1
,1

8
9
 

6
7
 

3
,9

9
6
 

5
,4

6
5
 

6
,7

2
4
 

8
,0

9
3
 

9
,7

7
6
 

1
1
,7

7
5
 

1
3
,4

5
5
 

1
5
,1

3
3
 

1
6
,8

1
9
 

1
8
,4

9
9
 

6
8
 

3
,8

8
6
 

5
,2

9
2
 

6
,4

9
5
 

7
,7

5
9
 

9
,4

4
1
 

1
1
,3

0
8
 

1
2
,9

2
8
 

1
4
,6

7
3
 

1
6
,2

8
8
 

1
7
,9

5
1
 

6
9
 

3
,7

8
4
 

5
,1

3
0
 

6
,2

6
7
 

7
,4

2
2
 

9
,1

0
6
 

1
0
,8

4
8
 

1
2
,4

0
5
 

1
4
,2

0
8
 

1
5
,7

6
8
 

1
7
,4

0
2
 

7
0
 

3
,6

7
8
 

4
,9

6
4
 

6
,0

3
2
 

7
,0

8
5
 

8
,7

6
7
 

1
0
,3

8
1
 

1
1
,8

7
9
 

1
3
,7

4
7
 

1
5
,2

3
9
 

1
6
,8

6
0
 

7
1
 

3
,5

7
5
 

4
,7

9
0
 

5
,8

0
2
 

6
,7

4
6
 

8
,4

2
9
 

9
,9

2
0
 

1
1
,3

5
4
 

1
3
,2

8
5
 

1
4
,7

1
7
 

1
6
,3

1
4
 

7
2
 

3
,4

6
9
 

4
,6

2
5
 

5
,5

7
0
 

6
,4

1
3
 

8
,0

9
3
 

9
,4

6
2
 

1
0
,8

2
4
 

1
2
,8

2
2
 

1
4
,1

8
6
 

1
5
,7

6
8
 

7
3
 

3
,3

8
2
 

4
,5

4
3
 

5
,4

8
8
 

6
,2

8
6
 

7
,9

6
5
 

9
,2

5
0
 

1
0
,6

1
6
 

1
2
,4

8
8
 

1
3
,7

7
0
 

1
5
,3

0
3
 

7
4
 

3
,3

0
1
 

4
,4

5
6
 

5
,4

0
2
 

6
,1

6
0
 

7
,8

4
4
 

9
,0

3
7
 

1
0
,4

0
8
 

1
2
,1

5
3
 

1
3
,3

4
9
 

1
4
,8

3
0
 

7
5
 

3
,2

1
9
 

4
,3

7
6
 

5
,3

2
0
 

6
,0

3
2
 

7
,7

1
2
 

8
,8

2
9
 

1
0
,1

9
4
 

1
1
,8

1
4
 

1
2
,9

2
8
 

1
4
,3

7
5
 

7
6
 

3
,1

3
2
 

4
,2

8
5
 

5
,2

3
3
 

5
,9

0
7
 

7
,5

8
7
 

8
,6

2
2
 

9
,9

8
7
 

1
1
,4

7
8
 

1
2
,5

0
3
 

1
3
,9

1
9
 

7
7
 a

n
d
 

o
v
er

 
3
,0

5
1
 

4
,2

0
3
 

5
,1

5
2
 

5
,7

7
9
 

7
,4

6
2
 

8
,4

0
7
 

9
,7

7
6
 

1
1
,1

4
7
 

1
2
,0

8
8
 

1
3
,4

5
5
 



 5

 

TABLE 2 

1 

This table is for the determination of payments to dependants of deceased sufferers under 

regulation 4(2) or (6). 

2 

The relevant period is the period specified in regulation 3(2) or, in the case of a disabled 

person to whom regulation 6 applies, the first period specified in regulation 6(1)(b). 

3 

(1) Part A of the table prescribes payments to dependants of disabled persons who died as 

a result of a disease other than diffuse mesothelioma. 

(2) Part B of the table prescribes payments to dependants of disabled persons who died as 

a result of diffuse mesothelioma. 

4 

Part A of the table prescribes payments to— 

(a) dependants to whom industrial death benefit under section 108 of the Social 

Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992 is payable; 

(b) dependants of a person to whom disablement benefit under that section or under 

any corresponding provision of the former Industrial Injuries Acts was payable 

immediately before that person died; and 

(c) dependants of a person to whom disablement benefit would have been payable 

immediately before that person died but for the occurrence of one of the 

circumstances listed in regulation 5(1)(a)(iii), or but for the person’s disablement 

amounting to less than the appropriate percentage. 

 

Part A 

Age of 

disabled 

person on 

their last 

birthday 

before their 

death 

Percentage assessment for the relevant period 

 

10% 

or under £ 

11%-20% 

£ 

21%-30% 

£ 

31%-49% 

£ 

50% or over 

£ 

37 and under 22,367 38,136 42,758 44,023 45,071 

38 21,863 36,705 41,496 42,758 44,102 

39 21,360 35,275 40,235 41,495 43,135 

40 20,850 33,844 38,973 40,235 42,168 

41 20,348 32,416 37,712 38,973 41,202 

42 19,848 30,991 36,450 37,712 40,235 

43 18,937 29,139 35,314 36,576 39,310 

44 18,036 27,283 34,176 35,443 38,376 

45 17,133 25,435 33,044 34,306 37,457 

46 16,227 23,583 31,811 33,170 36,533 

47 15,324 21,734 30,778 32,040 35,610 

48 14,634 21,230 29,939 31,155 34,474 

49 13,935 20,725 29,093 30,272 33,337 

50 13,243 20,219 28,255 29,384 32,204 



 6

51 12,551 19,717 27,415 28,507 31,072 

52 11,857 19,214 26,573 27,623 29,939 

53 11,539 18,036 24,977 26,403 29,008 

54 11,225 16,857 23,375 25,184 28,086 

55 10,911 15,680 21,778 23,966 27,161 

56 10,596 14,503 20,180 22,749 26,230 

57 10,090 13,330 18,582 21,527 25,308 

58 9,290 12,484 16,757 19,386 22,749 

59 8,491 11,642 14,929 17,238 20,180 

60 7,697 10,808 13,095 15,094 17,618 

61 6,893 9,963 11,270 12,950 15,051 

62 6,095 9,127 9,437 10,808 12,484 

63 5,675 9,061 9,316 10,403 11,751 

64 5,264 8,491 9,184 10,006 11,024 

65 4,836 7,483 9,061 9,605 10,278 

66 4,417 6,476 8,113 9,207 9,545 

67 and over  3,051 4,203 5,152 5,779 7,462 

 

Part B 

Age of disabled person on their last birthday 

before their death 

Payment £ 

37 and under 45,071 

38 44,102 

39 43,135 

40 42,168 

41 41,202 

42 40,235 

43 39,310 

44 38,376 

45 37,457 

46 36,533 

47 35,610 

48 34,474 

49 33,337 

50 32,204 

51 31,072 

52 29,939 

53 29,008 

54 28,086 

55 27,161 

56 26,230 

57 25,308 

58 22,749 

59 20,180 

60 17,618 

61 15,051 

62 12,484 

63 11,751 

64 11,024 

65 10,278 

66 9,545 



 7

67 and over  7,462”. 

 

 

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Work and Pensions 

 

 Mark Harper 

 Minister of State 

3rd March 2015 Department for Work and Pensions 

 

 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations) 

Under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979 (c. 41) (“the Act”) lump sum 

payments may be made to certain persons disabled by a disease to which the Act applies, or to 

dependants of persons who were so disabled before they died. The diseases to which the Act 

applies are pneumoconiosis, byssinosis, diffuse mesothelioma, primary carcinoma of the lung 

(where accompanied by asbestosis or diffuse pleural thickening) and diffuse pleural thickening. 

These Regulations amend the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims) 

Regulations 1988 (S.I. 1988/668) (“the 1988 Regulations”). The amendments made by regulation 

2 have the effect of increasing the amounts payable under the 1988 Regulations. The increase in 

each case is 1.2 per cent rounded up or down to the nearest £1 as appropriate. 

By virtue of regulation 1(2), the amendments made by these Regulations apply only in relation to 

any case in which a person first fulfils the conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Act on 

or after 1st April 2015. 

A full impact assessment has not been published for this instrument as it has no impact on the 

private sector or civil society organisations. 
  

  

© Crown copyright 2015 

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo, 

Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament. 



£6.00 

UK2015030411   03/2015   19585 

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/503 

 


