STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2014 No. 869
SOCIAL SECURITY

The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers” Compensation) (Payment of
Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2014

Made - - - - 31st March 2014

Coming into force in accordance with regulation 1(1).

The Secretary of State for Work and Pensions makes the following Regulations in exercise of the
powers conferred by sections 1(1), (2) and (4) and 7(1) and (2) of the Pneumoconiosis etc.
(Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979(a).

In accordance with section 7(3) of that Act, a draft of this instrument was laid before Parliament
and approved by a resolution of each House of Parliament.

Citation, commencement and application

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
(Payment of Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2014 and come into force on the day after the day
on which they are made.

(2) These Regulations apply only in relation to any case in which a person first fulfils the
conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
Act 1979 on or after the day on which they come into force.

Amendment of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988

2.—(1) The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims) Regulations
1988(b) are amended as follows.

(2) In the proviso to regulation 5(1) (payment where death results from diffuse mesothelioma),
for “£2,936” substitute “£3,015”.

(3) In regulation 6(1)(a) (payment where pneumoconiosis accompanied by tuberculosis), for
“£6,073” (in both places) substitute “£6,237”.

(4) In regulation 8 (minimum amount payable to dependant) for “£2,936” substitute “£3,015”.
(5) For the Schedule to those Regulations, substitute—

(a) 1979 c. 41. Section 1 was amended by section 24 of the Social Security Act 1985 (c. 53) and section 7(3) was amended by
section 58 of the Welfare Reform Act 2007 (c. 5).
(b) S.I. 1988/668. S.I. 1989/552 and S.I. 2013/690 are relevant amending instruments.



“SCHEDULE Regulations 3,4, 5 and 6

TABLE 1
1

This table is for the determination of payments to disabled persons under regulation 3 or
regulation 6 and for the determination of payments to dependants of deceased sufferers
under regulation 4(1).

2

The relevant period is the period specified in regulation 3(2) or, in the case of a disabled
person to whom regulation 6 applies, the first period specified in regulation 6(1)(b).

3

(1) The age of the disabled person is their age determined in accordance with regulation
3(2) or, in the case of a disabled person to whom regulation 6 applies, regulation 6(1)(b).

(2) In determining the amount payable to a dependant of a disabled person under regulation
4(1), the age to be taken for the purpose of calculating the sum to be deducted from the
amount which would have been payable to the disabled person had they still been alive, is
the age of the deceased on their last birthday before their death.

4

The table prescribes payments to disabled persons to whom disablement benefits are
payable under section 108 of the Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992(a) or
under any corresponding provision of the former Industrial Injuries Acts(b), or would be
payable but for the disablement amounting to less than the appropriate percentage.

(a)
(b)

1992 ¢c. 4
“the former Industrial Injuries Acts” is defined in section 2(3) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act
1979.



91T'0Y ¥SS 8¢ L9L°9€E 681 028°ce LYTO€ LLTYC TeL'el1 vLS€El 909°L 09
1€S vy TLSTY LTI 1Y 86C°6¢ L8ELE [49 %3 TSL'LT 818°CT 619°C1 06€°8 65
7S8°8Y 161°LY €67 Sy SyL'eY 65611 £88'8¢ 61¢°1¢ 896°SC 99¢°LI 081°6 86
€LI'ES 9IS°IS rS86v 8818y 8TS9Y ITey Y68 v¢ 780°6C 801°61 0L66 LS
€E8YS €LI'ES 916°1¢ vS8°6v 881°8Y 00T°SY €TTLE 6EL°TE L8IIT YLI'TT 9¢
1059 €e8vs €LI'ES 9IS°IS rS86v 061°LY LYS 6€ 10t'7€ L9T°€T [43%4! gs
091°8S 10S°9¢ €E8YS ELIES 916°1¢ 981°6% 088°1¥ ¥SO°LE rre ST ¥8S°€1 143
128°6S 091°8¢S 10S°9¢ €e8vs ELI'ES 081°1S €0Tvy TIL'6E 1Tv'LT 88L Y1 €S
08%°19 128°6S 091°8S 1059 €E8'YS €LI'ES LTS9Y YLETY S67°6C 766°S1 (43
T18°€9 6119 €87°09 178°8S Y91°LS LIT°SS 981°6¥ L1TYY 659°0¢ T8T'L1 IS
9€1°99 TLY'Y9 T18°79 €SI'19 88165 Y91°LS LYS'IS L68'SY €T8IE 0LS'81 0¢
99%°89 €08°99 0r1°S9 8LY'€9 718°19 091°6S YOS vS 609°LYy $86°C¢ 85861 67
T6L°0L €T1°69 99t°L9 S08°S9 6€1°19 €SI'19 YOI°LS 9¢€6Y 8¥1vE 9r1°1C 8
SIT'EL YSYIL S6L°69 LT1°89 TLY'99 8¥1°€9 128°6S 960°1S 11€°6¢ 9¢¥°TT Ly
LY6'EL 18T°CL ST9°0L 19689 T0€°L9 01€Y9 €SI'19 00€°€S 12T°8¢ 6C6°€T 9y
8LLYL SIT'eL YSYIL S6L°69 LT1°89 YLY'S9 08+°29 6617°SS LTIV 9TH'ST S
909°SL LY6'EL 18T°CL ST9°0L 196'89 9€9°99 T18°€9 00L°LS Se0' vy 8169C 144
177°9L 8LLYL SIT'EL YSYIL S6L'69 008°L9 or1°69 S06'6S Tr6 9y 91+°8¢C 914
OLT'LL 909°SL LY6'EL 18T°CL ST9°0L 196°89 TLY'99 901°C9 vS8°6Y ¥06°6C (44
1€6'8L 0LT'LL 909°SL LY6'EL 18T°CL ST9°0L 80C°89 01€Y9 vreTs 806°0€ Iy
$65°08 1€6'8L OLT'LL 909°SL LY6°CL 18C°CL 956°69 01599 €8 YS 906°1¢ ov
96T°C8 £65°08 1€6'8L 0LT'LL L8ESL 6V6°€L €0L'IL 11L°89 8TELS 006°C€ 6¢
916°¢8 96TT8 £65°08 1€6'8L OLT'LL 909°GL ISY'EL T16°0L 128°6S 868°¢¢ 8¢
085°¢8 916°¢8 9678 £65°08 1€6'8L 0LT'LL Y61°SL SIT°EL 91¢79 7687 Jopun
pue /¢

F F F F F F F F F F
%001~ %06~ %08~ %0L- %09~ %08~ %0¥- %0E- %0C- 4opun 10 uosiad
bIl6 BI8 BIL BI9 BIS BlY BIE BIC DI %OI paIgvsIY
poriad jupaajas ayj 40f JUdUISSISSD ISDIUIILIJ Jo a3y




S6T°€l SY6'Il SI0° 11 099°6 LOE™8 YLEL 0ILS 160°S €SIy SI0’¢ I9A0

PUe LL
YSLET SSeTl TreET1 698°6 0TS'8 L6V'L LES'S ILT°S veTY S60°¢ 9L
SoTv1 SLLTI vLYTT €L0°01 vTL'8 129°L 096°S LST'S vTe'y I81°¢ SL
7S9v1 161°€1 600°CI S8T01 0€6°8 ISL°L L80°9 8¢E’S €0v'y 79T°€¢ YL
(749! LO9ET oveTI 06101 or1'6 1L8°L 1129 4 687t Tre'e €L
185°C1 81071 0L9°C1 969°01 0S€°6 L66°L LEE9 Y0S°S 0LSY 8TY'¢ L
12191 (4294 LTTET 61T°11 2086 6C¢'8 9999 €eL’S €eLy €es’e IL
099°91 850°ST ¥8S°€1 8ELTI 8ST01 €99°8 100°L 096°S S06'y 7€9°¢ 0L
961°L1 18S°C1 0v0'v1 85Tl 61L°01 8668 ree'L €61°9 690°S 6€LE 69
8ELLI S60°91 667 V1 SLLTI YLITT 62€°6 L99°L 8179 6TCS 0v8°¢ 89
08T'81 02991 ¥S6'11 S6C¢Cl SE9°'T1 099°6 L66'L 799 00t°S 676°¢ L9
8€6°0C LLT'61 0LS'LT 8T8SI 0v0'v1 6v0C1 208°6 L10°8 66£9 Soc'y 99
86S°¢T LE6'TT T61°0C 79¢°81 Sr91 6V V1 v19°11 88€°6 Y6LL 6LLY S9
T§T9C 0654T 808°CT 868°0C 798°81 €891 LI¥'El 6SL°01 06€°8 0TS 9
T16°8C 0ST'LT 9TH'ST 1€V°€C L9T1T LIT61 8CTSI 6C1TI 88€°6 809°S €9
€LSTE ¥06°6C €¥0°8T 896°SC 6L9°€T €09°1¢ TEO'LI (V! 98¢°01 €209 9
£68°SE TETYE YOP'TE LOY 0 61T '8¢ €26'ST £09°0C 02991 6C1°TI 1189 19




TABLE 2
1

This table is for the determination of payments to dependants of deceased sufferers under
regulation 4(2) or (6).

2

The relevant period is the period specified in regulation 3(2) or, in the case of a disabled
person to whom regulation 6 applies, the first period specified in regulation 6(1)(b).

3

(1) Part A of the table prescribes payments to dependants of disabled persons who died as a
result of a disease other than diffuse mesothelioma.

(2) Part B of the table prescribes payments to dependants of disabled persons who died as a
result of diffuse mesothelioma.

4
Part A of the table prescribes payments to-

(a) dependants to whom death benefit under section 108 of the Social Security
Contributions and Benefits Act 1992 is payable;

(b) dependants of a person to whom disablement benefit under that section or under any
corresponding provision of the former Industrial Injuries Acts was payable immediately
before that person died; and

(c) dependants of a person to whom disablement benefit would have been payable
immediately before that person died but for the occurrence of one of the circumstances
listed in regulation 5(1)(a)(iii), or but for the person’s disablement amounting to less than
the appropriate percentage.

Part A

Age of Percentage assessment for the relevant period

disabled

person on

Zﬁf;; LZ;[ 10% 11% 21% 31% 50%
before their | or under -20% -30% -49% or over
death £ £ £ £ £

37 and 22,102 37,684 42251 | 43501 | 44,537
under

38 21,604 36,270 41,004 42,251 43,579
39 21,107 34,857 39,758 41,003 42,624
40 20,603 33,443 38,511 39,758 41,668
41 20,107 32,032 37,265 38,511 40,713
42 19,613 30,624 36,018 37,265 39,758
43 18,712 28,793 34,895 36,142 38,844
44 17,822 26,959 33,771 35,023 37,921
45 16,930 25,133 32,652 33,899 37,013
46 16,035 23,303 31,434 32,777 36,100
47 15,142 21,476 30,413 31,660 35,188
48 14,460 20,978 29,584 30,786 34,065
49 13,770 20,479 28,748 29,913 32,942




50 13,086 19,979 27,920 29,036 31,822
51 12,402 19,483 27,090 28,169 30,704
52 11,716 18,986 26,258 27,295 29,584
53 11,402 17,822 24,681 26,090 28,664
54 11,092 16,657 23,098 24,885 27,753
55 10,782 15,494 21,520 23,682 26,839
56 10,470 14,331 19,941 22,479 25,919
57 9,970 13,172 18,362 21,272 25,008
58 9,180 12,336 16,558 19,156 22,479
59 8,390 11,504 14,752 17,034 19,941
60 7,606 10,680 12,940 14,915 17,409
61 6,811 9,845 11,136 12,796 14,873
62 6,023 9,019 9,325 10,680 12,336
63 5,608 8,954 9,206 10,280 11,612
64 5,202 8,390 9,075 9,887 10,893
65 4,779 7,394 8,954 9,491 10,156
66 4,365 6,399 8,017 9,098 9,432
67 and over | 3,015 4,153 5,091 5,710 7,374
Part B

Age of disabled person on their last birthday | Payment £

before their death

37 and under 44,537

38 43,579

39 42,624

40 41,668

41 40,713

42 39,758

43 38,844

44 37,921

45 37,013

46 36,100

47 35,188

48 34,065

49 32,942

50 31,822

51 30,704

52 29,584

53 28,664

54 27,753

55 26,839

56 25,919

57 25,008

58 22,479

59 19,941

60 17,409

61 14,873

62 12,336

63 11,612

64 10,893

65 10,156




66 9,432

67 and over 7,374

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Work and Pensions
Mike Penning
Minister of State
31st March 2014 Department for Work and Pensions

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

Under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’” Compensation) Act 1979 (c 41) (“the Act”) lump sum
payments may be made to certain persons disabled by a disease to which the Act applies, or to
dependants of persons who were so disabled before they died. The diseases to which the Act
applies are pneumoconiosis, byssinosis, diffuse mesothelioma, primary carcinoma of the lung
(where accompanied by asbestosis or diffuse pleural thickening) and diffuse pleural thickening.

These Regulations amend the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988 (SI 1988/668) (“the 1988 Regulations”). The amendments made by regulation 2
have the effect of increasing the amounts payable under the 1988 Regulations. The increase in
each case is 2.7 per cent rounded up or down to the nearest £1 as appropriate.

By virtue of regulation 1(2), the amendments made by these Regulations apply only in relation to
any case in which a person first fulfils the conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Act on
or after the day on which these Regulations come into force.

A full impact assessment has not been published for this instrument as it has no impact on the
private sector or civil society organisations.

© Crown copyright 2014

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo,
Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.



ISBN 978-0-11-111336-3

£6.00
UK2014033119 04/2014 19585

hitp://www.legislation. gov. uk/id/uksi/2014/369 1780111"113363




