
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Automatic Enrolment
(Earnings Trigger and Qualifying Earnings Band) Order 2014, Section 2. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2014 No. 623

The Automatic Enrolment (Earnings Trigger
and Qualifying Earnings Band) Order 2014

Increase of amounts

2.—(1)  In sections 3(1)(c) (automatic enrolment) and 5(1)(c) (automatic re-enrolment) of the
Act M1, for “£9,440” substitute “ £10,000 ”.

(2)  In section 13(1) (qualifying earnings) of the Act M2—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£5,668” substitute “ £5,772 ”; and
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£41,450” substitute “ £41,865 ”.

Marginal Citations
M1 Sections 3(1)(c) and 5(1)(c) were amended by S.I. 2013/667.
M2 Section 13(1) was amended by S.I. 2013/667.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/623/section/3/1/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/667
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/623/section/13/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/667


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Automatic Enrolment (Earnings
Trigger and Qualifying Earnings Band) Order 2014, Section 2.


