
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2012 No. 2712

The Police (Amendment No. 4) Regulations 2012

Part-time appointments: re-appointment as full-time member

3.—(1)  Regulation 5 of the 2003 Regulations (part-time appointments) is amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph (4)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “one month” substitute “2 months”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “3 months” substitute “4 months”.


