
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 508

CHARITIES, ENGLAND AND WALES

The Charities Acts 1992 and 1993
(Substitution of Sums) Order 2009

Made       -      -      -      - 5th March 2009

Laid before Parliament 11th March 2009

Coming into force 1st April 2009

THE CHARITIES ACTS 1992 AND 1993
(SUBSTITUTION OF SUMS) ORDER 2009

1. Citation, commencement and interpretation  
2. Amendments to the 1992 Act  
3. In section 58(3)— (a) in paragraph (a)(i) for “£5” substitute...  
4. In section 60(4) and (5) for “£50”, in each place...  
5. In section 60B(2) and (5)— (a) in paragraph (a)(i) for...  
6. In section 61— (a) in subsection (1)(a) for “£50” substitute...  
7. Amendments to the 1993 Act  
8. In section 40(2) for “£500” substitute “£1,000”.  
9. In section 42(3) for “£100,000” substitute “£250,000”.  

10. In section 43— (a) in subsection (1)(b) for “£2.8 million”...  
11. In section 45(3) and (3A) for “£10,000” substitute “£25,000”.  
12. Transitional provisions and savings  
13. The amendments made by article 4 do not affect the...  
14. The amendments made by article 6 do not affect—  
15. The amendment made by article 8 does not apply to...  
16. The amendments made by articles 9, 10 and 11 apply...  
17. Consequential revocation  

  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  


