Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 508

The Charities Acts 1992 and 1993
(Substitution of Sums) Order 2009

Amendments to the 1992 Act

6. In section 61—
(a) in subsection (1)(a) for “£50” substitute “£100”;
(b) in subsection (2) for “£50”, in both places, substitute “£100”;
(c) in subsection (3)(a) for “£50 substitute “£100”.



