
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2008 No. 1887

POLICE, ENGLAND AND WALES
PENSIONS, ENGLAND AND WALES

The Police Pensions (Amendment) Regulations 2008

Made       -      -      -      - 15th July 2008

Laid before Parliament 17th July 2008

Coming into force 8th August 2008

THE POLICE PENSIONS (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2008

1. Citation, commencement and extent  
2. Interpretation  
3. The Police Pensions Regulations 1987  
4. (1) In regulation A4 (meaning of certain expressions and references...  
5. (1) Regulation A6 (meaning of certain expressions in relation to...  
6. (1) Regulation A16 (transfers) is amended as follows.  
7. (1) Regulation A17 (retirement) is amended as follows.  
8. (1) Regulation A18 (compulsory retirement on account of age) is...  
9. (1) For regulation A18 (compulsory retirement on account of age)...  

10. (1) Regulation A19 (compulsory retirement on grounds of efficiency of...  
11. (1) Regulation B1 (policeman’s ordinary pension) is amended as follows....  
12. (1) Regulation B2 (policeman’s short service award) is amended as...  
13. The following regulation is inserted after regulation B2 (policeman’s

short...
 

14. (1) Regulation B7(4)(b) (commutation-general provision) is amended as
follows.

 

15. (1) Regulation E8 (increase of widow’s pension or child’s allowance...  
16. In regulation E10(3)(b) (determination of amount of widow’s or child’s...  
17. (1) Regulation G1 (pensionable and average pensionable pay) is amended...  
18. (1) Regulation K1 (cancellation of ill-health and injury pensions) is...  
19. For paragraph (a) of the proviso to Regulation K3 (reduction...  
20. (1) Schedule A (glossary of expressions) is amended as follows....  
21. (1) Part III of Schedule B (policeman’s ill-health pension) is...  
22. (1) Part VI of Schedule B (policeman’s deferred pension) is...  
23. (1) Part I of Schedule F (pensionable service and transfer...  
24. The Police Pensions (Purchase of Increased Benefits) Regulations 1987  
25. (1) Regulation 2 (interpretation) is amended as follows.  



Document Generated: 2023-05-26
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

26. (1) Regulation 3 (election to purchase increase benefits) is amended...  
27. (1) Part I of the Schedule (payments) is amended as...  
28. The Police (Injury Benefit) Regulations 2006  
29. (1) Regulation 3 (meaning of certain expressions in relation to...  
30. (1) Regulation 6 (injury received in the execution of duty)...  
31. (1) Schedule 1 (glossary of expressions) is amended as follows....  
32. The Police Pensions Regulations 2006  
33. (1) Regulation 3 (meaning of certain expressions in relation to...  
34. In regulation 5 (transfers), at the end of paragraph (b),...  
35. (1) Regulation 17 (retirement) is amended as follows.  
36. (1) Regulation 18 (voluntary retirement) is amended as follows.  
37. (1) Regulation 19 (compulsory retirement on account of age) is...  
38. (1) Regulation 20 (compulsory retirement on grounds of efficiency of...  
39. In regulation 23 (pensionable pay) at the end insert “and...  
40. (1) Regulation 51 (review and cancellation of pensions payable on...  
41. (1) Schedule 1 (glossary of expressions) is amended as follows....  
42. (1) Schedule 5 (amendment of the Police (Injury Benefit) Regulations...  
43. The Police Pension Fund Regulations 2007  
44. (1) Regulation 2 (interpretation) is amended as follows.  
45. (1) Regulation 4 (particular payments into and out of the...  
46. In regulation 5(1) (police authority contributions) for “24.6%” substitute

“24.2%”....
 

47. In regulation 12(4) (particular cases)— (a) for “24.6%” substitute
“24.2%”;...

 

48. After regulation 12, insert the following regulation— (1) In the application
of these Regulations to SOCA as...

 

  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  


