
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2008 No. 1444

The Road Vehicles (Registration and Licensing)
(Amendment) (No. 2) Regulations 2008

Amendments to Schedule 2 (reduced pollution certificates and the reduced pollution
requirements)

3.—(1)  Schedule 2 shall be amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph 12(2)(c)(i), for “the Goods Vehicle Centre, Welcombe House, 91/92 The Strand,

Swansea SA1 2DH” substitute “such office of the Vehicle and Operator Services Agency as he may
direct”.

(3)  In paragraph 13—
(a) in sub-paragraph (1)(a), for “£28” substitute “£29”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (3), for “£6” substitute “£7”.

[DfT 00051]


