
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 1053

The Child Benefit Up-rating Order 2007

Citation and Commencement

1. This Order may be cited as the Child Benefit Up-rating Order 2007 and shall come into force
on 9th April 2007.

Amendment of the Child Benefit (Rates) Regulations 2006

2. In regulation 2(1) of the Child Benefit (Rates) Regulations 2006 (1)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£17.45” substitute “£18.10”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£11.70” substitute “£12.10”.

28th March 2007

Claire Ward
Dave Watts

Two of the Lords Commissioners of Her
Majesty’s Treasury

(1) S.I. 2006/965.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/965

