Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

N —

Nounkw

10.
11.
12.
13.
14.
15.
16.
17.
18.
19.
20.
21.

2006 No. 749
PENSIONS

The Judicial Pensions (Contributions)
(Amendment) Regulations 2006

Made - - - - 13th March 2006
Laid before Parliament 16th March 2006
Coming into force oth April 2006

THE JUDICIAL PENSIONS (CONTRIBUTIONS)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006

Citation and Commencement

Amendments to the Judicial Pensions (Widows' and Children’s Benefits)
Regulations 1987

(1) In regulation 8(2) (Election to make periodical payments), in...

For regulation 9(2) (Additional payments for back service), substitute—
In regulation 10(4) (Method of payment), for the words “15...
Regulation 13(2) (Refunds of periodical payments) is revoked.
Amendments to the Judicial Pensions (Widowers' and Children’s Benefits)
Regulations 1991

(1) In regulation 8(2) (Election to make periodical payments), in...

For regulation 9(2) (Additional payments for back service in relation...
For regulation 9A(2) (Additional payments for back service in relation...
In regulation 10(4) (Method of payment), for the words “15...
Regulation 13(2) (Refunds of periodical payments) is revoked.
Amendments to the Judicial Pensions (Contributions) Regulations 1998
In regulation 6(1) (Rate of contributions under section 9), for...

In regulation 10 (Calculation of contributions credit), after paragraph (5),...
In regulation 11 (Additional contributions), in paragraph (3), for the...
Regulation 11(4) is revoked.

In regulation 11(6), for “3%”, substitute “1.8%”.

In regulation 11(7), for “3%”, in each place, substitute “1.8%"....
Regulation 13(7) (Contributions adjustment) is revoked.

Saving

Signature

Explanatory Note



