
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2005 No. 2019

The National Minimum Wage Regulations
1999 (Amendment) Regulations 2005

Amendments to the Principal Regulations

4. In regulation 13 of the Principal Regulations (workers who qualify for the national minimum
wage at a different rate)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(1), for “£4.10” substitute “£4.25”; and
(b) in paragraph (2)(2), for “£4.10” substitute “£4.25”.

(1) Regulation 13(1) was amended, and the amount increased, by S.I.2000/1411, S.I. 2001/2763, S.I. 2002/1999, S.I. 2003/1923
and S.I. 2004/1930.

(2) Regulation 13(2) was amended, and the amount increased, by S.I. 2001/2763, S.I. 2002/1999, S.I. 2003/1923 and S.I.
2004/1930.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2000/1411
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/2763
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/1999
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/1923
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/1930
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/2763
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/1999
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/1923
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/1930

