
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2005 No. 1997

The Registration of Births, Deaths and
Marriages (Fees) (Amendment) Order 2005

Amendment of the principal Order

2. In the Schedule to the principal Order the entries made in respect of the Marriage Act 1949
are amended as follows—

(a) in the entry relating to section 27(7) (attendance of superintendent registrar other than at
his office etc), in column (4), for “£40.00” substitute “£47.00”;

(b) in the entry relating to section 51(1) (fee of registrar for attending marriage), in column
(4), for “£34.00” and “£40.00” substitute respectively “£40.00” and “£47.00”; and

(c) in the entry relating to section 51(2) (fee of superintendent registrar attending marriage
etc), in column (4), for “£40.00” substitute “£47.00”.


