
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2002 No. 2641

ROAD TRAFFIC

The Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences)
(Amendment) Regulations 2002

Made       -      -      -      - 21st October 2002

Laid before Parliament 23rd October 2002

Coming into force 14th November 2002

THE MOTOR VEHICLES (DRIVING LICENCES)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2002

1. Citation and commencement  
2. Amendments to the Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences) Regulations 1999  
3. In regulation 3(1) in the definition of “theory test” for...  
4. In regulation 30(1)(b) for “£15.50” there shall be substituted “£18”....  
5. In regulation 40— (1) In paragraph (2)(a) for the words...  
6. In Regulation 47(8) for “£5” there shall be substituted “£7.50”....  
7. In Regulation 48(3)(a) for “£2.43” there shall be substituted “£2.75”....  
8. For the table in Schedule 5 (fees for practical and...  

  Signature  

SCHEDULE — SUBSTITUTED TABLES IN SCHEDULE 5

  Explanatory Note  


