Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1999 No. 566

The Medicines for Human Use and Medical Devices
(Fees and Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 1999

Amendment of the Homoeopathic Products Regulations

2.—(1) In regulation 14 of the Homoeopathic Products Regulations(1) (fees for variations of
certificates)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£75” there shall be substituted “£80”;

(b) in paragraph (1)(b)(i), for “£75” there shall be substituted “£80”;

(c) in paragraph (1)(b)(ii), for “£37.50” there shall be substituted “£40”;

(d) in paragraph (2)(a), for “£150” there shall be substituted “£155”;

(e) in paragraph (2)(b)(i), for “£150” there shall be substituted “£155”; and

(f) in paragraph (2)(b), for heads (ii) and (iii) there shall be substituted the following heads—

“(ii) in respect of each other application so considered, where further medical,
technical or scientific assessment is required, a fee of £155,

(iii) in respect of the second to thirtieth applications so considered, where no further
medical, technical or scientific assessment is required, a fee of £77.50, and

(iv) in respect of each other application so considered, where no further medical,
technical or scientific assessment is required, a fee of £38.75.”.

(2) In the Table in Schedule 2 to the Homoeopathic Products Regulations (fees for applications
for the grant of certificates of registration)—

(a) in column (2) (fees for applications in respect of products prepared from not more than
5 homoeopathic stocks)—

(1) for “£90” there shall be substituted “£95”,
(i) for “£270” there shall be substituted “£285”, and
(iii) for “£450” there shall be substituted “£470”’; and
(b) in column (3) (fees for other applications)—
(i) for “£225” there shall be substituted “£235”,
(i) for “£400” there shall be substituted “£420”, and
(ii1) for “£585” there shall be substituted “£615”.

(1) See regulation 2(3) of S.1.1998/574.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1998/574

