
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1998 No. 615

REGISTRATION OF BIRTHS,
DEATHS, MARRIAGES, ETC.

ENGLAND AND WALES

The Adopted Persons (Contact Register)
(Fees) (Amendment) Rules 1998

Made       -      -      -      - 9th March 1998

Laid before Parliament 10th March 1998

Coming into force       -      - 1st April 1998

The Secretary of State for Health, in exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 51A(3) and
(5) of the Adoption Act 1976(1) and of all other powers enabling him in that behalf, hereby makes
the following Rules:—

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Adopted Persons (Contact Register) (Fees) (Amendment)
Rules 1998 and shall come into force on 1st April 1998.

Amendment of the Adopted Persons (Contact Register) (Fees) Rules 1991

2. In rule 2 of the Adopted Persons (Contact Register) (Fees) Rules 1991(2) (fees payable for
entries in the register) —

(a) in paragraph (1) for “£9.50” there shall be substituted “£15.00”; and
(b) in paragraph (2) for “£27.50” there shall be substituted “£30.00”.

(1) 1976 c. 36. Section 51A was inserted by section 88(1) of, and paragraph 21 of Schedule 10 to, the Children Act 1989 (c. 41).
See sections 51A(13)(c) and 72(1) for definitions of “prescribed”.

(2) S.I.1991/952.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1976/36
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1989/41
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/952


Document Generated: 2023-06-28
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Health

9th March 1998

Paul Boateng
Parliamentary Under Secretary,

Department of Health

2



Document Generated: 2023-06-28
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Rules)

These Rules amend the Adopted Persons (Contact Register) (Fees) Rules 1991 with effect from 1st
April 1998. They increase the fee payable for the entry of the name and address of an adopted person
from £9.50 to £15.00 and for the entry of the name and address of a relative of an adopted person
from £27.50 to £30.00 in the Adoption Contact Register. The register is maintained by the Registrar
General under section 51A of the Adoption Act 1976.

3


