
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1994 No. 2615

The Firearms (Variation of Fees) Order 1994

4. Section 32(1) of the 1968 Act (which relates to fees for firearm and shot gun certificates and
which was set out, as amended, in Part I of Schedule 1 to the 1990 Order) shall have effect subject
to the following amendments—

(a) in paragraph (a) for “£46” there shall be substituted “£56”;
(b) in paragraph (d) for “£17” there shall be substituted “£43”;
(c) in paragraph (e) for “£11” there shall be substituted “£18”;

and accordingly the said section 32(1) shall have effect as set out in Part I of Schedule 1 to this
Order.


