
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1994 No. 1533

WATER, ENGLAND AND WALES
WATER SUPPLY, SCOTLAND

The Reservoirs (Panels of Civil Engineers)
(Application Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 1994

Made       -      -      -      - 8th June 1994

Coming into force       -      - 1st July 1994

The Secretary of State for the Environment as respects England, the Secretary of State for Wales as
respects Wales and the Secretary of State for Scotland as respects Scotland, in exercise of powers
conferred on them by sections 4(2) and 5 of the Reservoirs Act 1975(1), hereby make the following
Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Reservoirs (Panels of Civil Engineers) (Application
Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 1994, and shall come into force on 1st July 1994.

Application fees

2. Regulation 2(2) of the Reservoirs (Panels of Civil Engineers) (Applications and Fees)
Regulations 1992(2) shall be amended as follows—

(a) in paragraph (a), for “£200” substitute “£230”;
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£160” substitute “£185”;

17th May 1994
John Selwyn Gummer

Secretary of State for the Environment

(1) 1975 c. 23.
(2) S.I.1992/1527.

[DET 7315]

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1975/23
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/1527


Document Generated: 2023-06-27
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

25th May 1994
John Redwood

Secretary of State for Wales

8th June 1994

Hector Monro
Parliamentary Under-Secretary of State, Scottish

Office

2



Document Generated: 2023-06-27
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the Reservoirs (Panels of Civil Engineers) (Applications and Fees)
Regulations 1992, which prescribe the manner in which a civil engineer may apply to be appointed
or reappointed to an existing panel of civil engineers set up for the purposes of the Reservoirs Act
1975, and the fee to accompany such an application, by increasing the fee for a first appointment to
any panel to £230, and the fee for reappointment to any panel to £185.

3


