
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1992 No. 2007

SOCIAL SERVICES, ENGLAND AND WALES

The Residential Care Homes (Amendment) Regulations 1992

Made       -      -      -      - 19th August 1992

Laid before Parliament 25th August 1992

Coming into force       -      - 1st October 1992

The Secretary of State for Health, in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 5(1), 8 and 56(4)
of the Registered Homes Act 1984(1) and of all other powers enabling her in that behalf, hereby
makes the following Regulations:—

Citation, commencement and interpretation

1.—(1)  These Regulations may be cited as the Residential Care Homes (Amendment)
Regulations 1992 and shall come into force on 1st October 1992.

(2)  In these Regulations “the principal Regulations” means the Residential Care Homes
Regulations 1984(2).

Amendment of regulation 3 of the principal Regulations

2. In regulation 3 of the principal Regulations (fees on application for registration)—
(a) in paragraph (1) the words “Subject to paragraph (2) of this regulation,” shall be omitted;
(b) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£210” there shall be substituted “£230”;
(c) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£770” there shall be substituted “£840”;
(d) paragraph (2) shall be revoked.

Amendment of regulation 5 of the principal Regulations

3. In regulation 5(1) of the principal Regulations (annual fee) for “£37” there shall be substituted
“£41”.

(1) 1984 c. 23.
(2) S.I.1984/1345, as amended by S.I. 1986/457, 1988/1192,and 1991/2502.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1984/23
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1984/1345
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1986/457
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1988/1192
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2502


Document Generated: 2023-06-27
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Revocations

4. Regulations 2 and 3 of the Residential Care Homes (Amendment) Regulations 1986(3),
regulations 2 and 3 of the Residential Care Homes (Amendment) Regulations 1988(4), and
regulations 5 and 6 of the Residential Care Homes (Amendment) Regulations 1991(5) are hereby
revoked.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Health

19th August 1992

Tom Sackville
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State,

Department of Health

(3) S.I. 1986/457.
(4) S.I. 1988/1192.
(5) S.I. 1991/2502.

2

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1986/457
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1988/1192
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2502


Document Generated: 2023-06-27
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the Residential Care Homes Regulations 1984.
They increase the registration fees payable on applications in respect of non-controlling managers
of homes from £210 to £230 and on applications in respect of persons in control of homes from
£770 to £840 and revoke regulation 3(2) of the 1984 Regulations which makes separate provision
for applications on changes of ownership.
They increase the annual fee payable in respect of each person in the home, from £37 to £41.
They revoke earlier provisions of regulations (superseded by these Regulations) which laid down
the amounts of the registration fees and the annual fee.

3


