
STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1990 No. 2164

PUBLIC HEALTH, ENGLAND AND WALES

The Nursing Homes and Mental Nursing Homes
(Amendment) Regulations 1990

Made - - - - Ist November 1990

Laid before Parliament 7th November 1990

Coming into force 3rd December 1990

The Secretary of State for Health, in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 23(3)(b)
and 56(4) of the Registered Homes Act 1984(a) and all other powers enabling him in
that behalf, hereby makes the following Regulations:—

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Nursing Homes and Mental Nursing Homes
(Amendment) Regulations 1990 and shall come into force on 3rd December 1990.

Amendment of Schedule 1

2. Schedule 1 to the Nursing Homes and Mental Nursing Homes Regulations 1984(b)
(fees to accompany applications) shall be amended as follows—

(a) in paragraph | for “£600” there shall be substituted “£678”; and

(b) in paragraph 2 for “£380” there shall be substituted “£410”.

Revocations

3. The Nursing Homes and Mental Nursing Homes (Amendment) Regulations
1986(c) and regulation 2 of the Nursing Homes and Mental Nursing Homes (Amendment)
Regulations 1988(d) are hereby revoked.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Health.

Virginia Bottomley
Minister of State,

lst November 1990 Department of Health

(a) 1984 ¢.23. (b) S.L. 1984/1578; relevant amending instruments are S.f. 1986/456 and 1988/1191. (c) S.1.
1986/456. (d) S.1. 1988/1191.



EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations increase the fees payable under the Nursing Homes and Mental
Nursing Homes Regulations 1984.

The fee to accompany an application for registration is increased from £600 to £678,
©

and the fee to accompany such an application on a proposed change ofownership, where
there are no other changes in relation to the home, is increased from £380 to £410 (reg-
ulation 2).
The Regulations also revoke the Nursing Homes and Mental Nursing Homes

(Amendment) Regulations 1986 and regulation 2 of the Nursing Homes and Mental
Nursing Homes (Amendment) Regulations 1988, which replaced the fees prescribed which
are in turn replaced by the fees prescribed by these Regulations (regulation 3).

65p
© Crown copyright 1997
Reprinted 1997

ISBN 0-11-005164-5

Printed in the UK for and published by The Stationery Office Limited
under the authority and superintendence of Peter Macdonald,
Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of
Acts of Parliament.

WO 1015 5/97 1731 56219 ON 341616 9 780110 051642 >


