
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1987 No. 136

HOVERCRAFT

The Hovercraft (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 1987

Made       -      -      -      - 4th February 1987

Coming into force       -      - 25th February 1987

The Secretary of State for Transport, with the approval of the Treasury and in exercise of his powers
under Article 35 of the Hovercraft (General) Order 1972(1) and of all other powers enabling him in
that behalf, hereby makes the following Regulations:—

1. The Regulations may be cited as the Hovercraft (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 1987 and
shall come into force on 25th February 1987.

2. The Schedule to the Hovercraft (Fees) Regulations 1985(2) shall be amended as follows:—
(1)  In paragraph 10, in sub-paragraphs (1) and (2) for “£41.50” there shall be substituted

“£45.50”.
(2)  In paragraph 11, for “£41.50” there shall be substituted “£45.50”.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State.

4th February 1987

Michael Spicer
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State,

Department of Transport

(1) S.I.1972/674.
(2) S.I. 1985/1605.

[DET 5830]

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1972/674
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1985/1605


Document Generated: 2023-12-30
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

We approve the making of these Regulations,

4th February 1987

Mark Lennox-Boyd
Tim Sainsbury

Two of the Lords Commissioners of Her
Majesty`s Treasury

2



Document Generated: 2023-12-30
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the Hovercraft (Fees) Regulations 1985 by prescribing increased fees
payable to the Secretary of State for the issue of operating permits for hovercraft, and exemptions,
under the Hovercraft (General) Order 1972. The increase is of 9.64 per cent.

3


