5053

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1982 No. 1723 (S. 184)

COURT OF SESSION, SCOTLAND

Act of Sederunt (Rules of Court Amendment No. 7) (Witnesses’
Fees) 1982

Made - - - - 30th November 1982
Coming into Operation 6th January 1983

The Lords of Council and Session, under and by virtue of the powers
conferred upon them by section 16 of the Administration of Justice (Scotland)
Act 1933 (a) and of all other powers competent to them in that behalf, do
hereby enact and declare:—

Citation and commencement

1.—(1) This Act of Sederunt may be cited as the Act of Sederunt (Rules of
Court Amendment No. 7) (Witnesses’ Fees) 1982 and shall come into
operation on 6th January 1983.

(2) This Act of Sederunt shall be inserted in the Books of Sederunt.

Amendment to Rules of Court

2. In paragraph 2 of Chapter II of Rule 347 of the Rules of Court (b)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a)(i)—

(i) for the figure “£35” substitute “£38”;

(ii) for the figure “£20” substitute “£25”;
(b) for sub-paragraph (a)(ii) substitute the following—

“(ii) in respect of perusing papers for the purpose of giving evidence

such sum not exceeding £50 as the Auditor may determine;”’;

(c) in sub-paragraph (b)(i), for the figure “£30’ substitute “£40”.

Emslie,
Lord President.
I.P.D.
Edinburgh.
30th November 1982.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Act of Sederunt.)

This Act of Sederunt amends the Rules of Court by increasing the fees
payable to professional witnesses in judicial proceedings.

§a; 1933 c.41.
b) S.I. 1965/321; relevant amending instrument is S.I. 1980/909.



T

00000000000



	
	

