STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1980 No. 751

LANDLORD AND TENANT
AGRICULTURAL HOLDINGS

The Agriculture (Calculation of Value for Compensation)
(Amendment) Regulations 1980

Made - - - - 2nd June 1980
Laid before Parliament 10th June 1980
Coming into Operation 1st July 1980

The Minister of Agriculture, Fisheries and Food, in relation to England,
and the Secretary of State for Wales, in relation to Wales, with the advice of
the committees respectively appointed by them(a) under the provisions of
section 79 of the Agricultural Holdings Act 1948(b) and in exercise of the
powers conferred by section 51(1) of the Agricultural Holdings Act 1948, and
now vested in them(a), and of all other powers enabling them in that behalf,
hereby make the following regulations:—

Citation, commencement and interpretation

1.—(1) These regulations may be cited as the Agriculture (Calculation of
Value for Compensation) (Amendment) Regulations 1980 and shall come into
operation on 1st July 1980.

(2) In these regulations “the principal regulations” means the Agriculture
(Calculation of Value for Compensation) Regulations 1978(c).

Application

2. These regulations shall apply in relation to the calculation of the value of
improvements and other matters in any case where the tenancy of the outgoing
tenant claiming compensation for such improvements and other matters by
virtue of the provisions of the Agricultural Holdings Act 1948 terminates on
or after the day on which these regulations shall come into operation.

Amendment of principal regulations

3.—(1) Part I of Schedule 1 to the principal regulations shall be amended so
that for Tables 2, 3, 4, 5(a), 5(b), 5(c), 5(d), 5(e), 5(f), 5(g), 5(k) and 5( j) set out
therein there shall be substituted respectively Tables 2, 3, 4, 5(a), 5(b), 5(c),
5(d), 5(e), 5(f), 5(g), 5(h) and 5 (j) set out in the Schedule to these regulations.

(2) Part II of Schedule 1 to the principal regulations shall be amended as
follows:—

(@) in paragraph 11(1), for “four pounds per sheep” there shall be sub-
stituted ““eight pounds per sheep”;

(a) In the case of the Secretary of State for Wales, by virtue of S.I. 1978/272.
(b) 1948 c. 63. (c) S.I. 1978/809.



(b) in paragraph 12(2)(a)—
(i) for “£18 per hectare” there shall be substituted “£24 per
hectare™;
(i) for “£30 per hectare” there shall be substituted “£40 per
hectare”;
(¢) in paragraph 12(2)(b)—
(i) for “£6 per hectare” there shall be substituted “£8 per hectare”;
(ii) for “£36 per hectare” there shall be substituted ““£48 per hectare”;
(iii) for ““£48 per hectare” there shall be substituted “£64 per hectare”;
(d) in paragraph 12(3), for “£148 per hectare” there shall be substituted
“£164 per hectare”.

In Witness whereof the Official Seal of the Minister of Agriculture, Fisheries
and Food is hereunto affixed on 22nd May 1980.

(L.S.)
Peter Walker,
Minister of Agriculture, Fisheries and Food.
Nicholas Edwards,

2nd June 1980. Secretary of State for Wales.



SCHEDULE Regulation 3
TABLE 2

Unit Value of Phosphoric acid (as P,O;) in one per cent of a tonne of fertiliser

After
Nature of fertiliser
ONE TWO THREE
growing seasons

. . . . . p p p
1. Organic forms and inorganic forms (including basic
slag) but excluding rock phosphates and calcined

calcium aluminium phosphate 146 73 36

2. Soft ground rock phosphates(*) applied in—
(a) areas with a mean excess winter rainfall(?) of
450mm or more 146 73 36
(b) areas with a mean excess winter rainfall(?) of
less than 450mm
(i) Permanent grassland 146 73 36
(ii) Other crops nil nil nil

3. Other ground rock phosphates applied in—
(a) areas with a mean excess winter rainfall(?) of

450mm or more 36 36 36
(b) areas with a mean excess winter rainfall(?) of
less than 450mm nil nil nil
4. Calcined calcium aluminium phosphate The value, if any, shall be such

as may be determined in
accordance with scientific evi-
dence.

NOTES:
(®) Soft ground rock phosphates in this Table means the material of that name described
in Group 2(a) in Section A of Schedule 1 to the Fertilisers Regulations 1977(a).

(®) Data of the mean excess winter rainfall in different areas of England and Wales are
produced by the Meteorological Office.

(a) S.1. 1977/1489.



TABLE 3

Unit Value of Potash (K,0) in one per cent of a tonne of fertiliser

Type of crops to which fertiliser applied

v

. Applied to arable crops (except forage crops) and all
root crops where tops are left on the land, except
potatoes (see also 4 below)

. Applied to leys, permanent grassland or forage crops
which are grazed or the product cut and fed on the
holding

. Applied to leys and permanent grassland the product
of which is cut and removed from the holding

. Applied to roots (including potatoes) and forage crops
which are removed from the holding

After
ONE TWO THREE
growing seasons
p p p
83 41 nil
83 41 nil
nil nil nil
nil nil nil




TABLE 4

Value per tonne of purchased farmyard manure

Type of manure No crop off onegfsving two‘:ﬁ?)‘ving threeAg?)rwing
season seasons seasons

P P p P
Cattle (FYM) 565 283 141 nil
Horse (stable manure) 625 313 156 nil
Pig (FYM) 605 303 151 nil
Poultry (deep litter) 1,150 575 288 nil
Poultry (broiler manure) 1,360 680 340 nil




33 137 99 98 LT SZIe]N "81

9% LS 6 141 8T $180 LI

144 ¥s 88 601 LIT 1B3YM 91

34 6S 98 811 LET Adleq Gl

69 £6 8¢l L81 yLE sead p[aL] ‘y1

6 I 81 e L8y sueaq ppRIg ¢l

1T [44 34 134 L8 (1om) sureid siomalg |

9 Ll 4! ve L9 (Nd 781 passaxd
siqnop—iam) dind 199q 1e3ng ‘I

1€ 8 9 891 9tt (passejow-pauip) dind 199q 1e3ng "Qf

6 £C 81 Ly ¥6 $307e10d "6

S 4! oI Y4 0s sdiwing, g

S 4! ol 144 67 Sopamg °L

S 91 ol [43 9 SjeSuBN "9

81 LE 9¢ 1 14! Mmeng ¢

¥9 94! 8CI 06T 186 uxdn| psixd ‘y

09 vl ITI 8¢ §9¢ sse13 pal ‘¢

vs LTI L0l 1354 90§ Ley 1200) T

LE 01 L 80T Sy Key sse1n °[

d d d d d
puej| 2y} uo 139[ pue| 9y} uo 1Jo|
Surpjoy are yorgm jo sdoj ay3 sdoid Suipjoy are yorym jo sdoy ay3 sdoso
9y} WOIJ PIAOWAI | JOOI JO JO SUIP[OY Y} UO PaJ | Y} WOJJ PIAOWSI | 3001 JO 10 SUIP[OY 39U} UO P9 | Jo
s130npoid ay} pue 1nd jonpoid sy} 10 pazeid st 3onpoad oy} pue 0o jonpoid ayy 10 pazeid | dow pn3s SuIpasg
sdoio a8ri10J 10 pur[sseId a1oym sdoud d3e10j sdoio a3e10j 10 pue[sSeId ON

aroym sdoxo o3eiog
JO S)001 ‘pue[ssers
jusueuwrrad ‘s£9] Jo

juouewIad ‘sA9] JO 10 (sdoxd
a3e10J 1dooxs) sdoio s|qere jo

JO S)001 ‘puelsseid
jusueurrad ‘s3] Jo

jusuewrad ‘s£9f Jo 10 (sdoxd
a3e10j 1deoxs) sdoIo a[qere Jo

SUOSEas JUIMOI3 0M] 191V

uoseas SuIMoI3 suo 1YY

amuey predureJ—dsoys pue saA[e) ‘OpeD
(v)s F1av],

ANNOJ, ¥dd S4dNLS DNIGIF 40 SANIVA TVIIOANVIA ILSNVHXAN()



6£T

dD
% 1 yoed 10j :9%®d vov::oam%m
®oIn pmbiy

Aoym pmbry -

(pmnbiy) y[Iw pawrwIyg
Il pawrunys pali

JeSW duoq pue JBIN

Jeswr 3B

[eow/oxed passadey

9)®0 JNUPUNOIS PAILOII0dd(
[eawr/a)ed INuU0d0)
[eaw/ayed [PuISy wied
[eaw/ayed passul|

5D U03100 PIJBd1II033PUN)
98O U03J100 PA)LOII09J
Jesw uesq eAOS

et UysLy

dind snnp

SUBdq ISNO0

doyo Aurwoy

(oo1uBy) BARBSSBD
uelg/SSUlPPIN

Jeaur sory

‘61



SI LT [43 SL 6v1 9ZIeN ‘81
| ¥4 147 (43 L6 S61 S1eQ °LI
€T (33 0oL §6 061 jeayM 9]
| ¥4 or 89 901 (414 Aopreg “G1
9z S €01 091 0ze sead pLy I
8¢ €L 6¢1 (1] 14 /44 Sueaq PRI €l
01 oI €€ 143 L9 (1o9m) sure1s sromarg “Z|
I €1 8 3% 99 (N 7 81 passaxd
siqnop—j3am) dind 395q resSng ‘1|
14 L9 o 991 1€ (passejow-papp) dind 300q 1e3ng “Qf
€ 0T ¢l 14 $6 sa03810d °6
[4 I 8 Y4 0¢ sdiumy, °g
4 II 8 194 0s Sopamg °L
€ 91 8 be 89 S[eSuey -9
S 8¢ L4 0L 34} meng °¢
61 STT 16 €8¢ 99¢ auleon] paL 'y
0C 91l 88 6LC 8S¢S SseI3 poal( ¢
81 Y0l 8L 0sT 10§ Ary JaA0[) T
[4! 16 139 (414 vy Aey sse1n °f
d d d d d
puej 943 uo 3J9| puej a3 uo 3J9|
Surpjoy are yoiym Jjo sdoy ayy sdomo Suipjoy aIe yoym Jjo sdoy ayy sdoxo
9y} WOIJ PIAOWAI | 300I JO IO SUIp[OY 9Y} UO P3J | Y} WOIJ PIAOWdI | 300J JO JO SUIp[oy 9y} Uuo paj | o
st 3onpoid ay3 pue 1nd jonpoid ay3 10 pazeid st Jonpoad ay} pue 1nd jonpoad 9y} Jo pazeld | doxd pnys SuIpadq

a1oym sdoid o8eIog sdoxo a3e10] 10 pue[sseisd a1oym sdoad a5eioj sdoid 95e10j 10 puejssesd ON

J0 sjoo1 ‘pueysseid | juouewIad ‘s3] Jo Jo (sdoxd> | 10 sjoo1 ‘puelsseid | jusueurrad ‘sA9] Jo IO (sdoid

juouewiad ‘sA9] Jo | aSeiof 3dooxs) sdoio sjqere jo | jusuewnrad ‘sof Jo | o310y 3daoxo) sdoid 9jqeIe Jo

SUOS®as SUIMOI3 0M] 1YY uosess Suimoisd auo 1y

A1mpg pesojD—daayg pue soA[e) ‘O[IeD
(9)s a1avy
HNNOJ, ¥ad S44nLS ONIGHE] 40 SANIVA TVIENNVIA GLISNVHXEN()



9L
(4.4

dD %1

yoee 10§ :9)ed papunodwio)
I

®aIn pinbry

Koym pmbry -

(pmbyy) Y[ pawwNS

i pawiys pala

Jeaur duoq pue Jed]A

Jeauwr el

[esw/o)es passadey

90 JNUpUNOI3 PI}edRIR
[eauw/a)ed INU00D)
Jeawr/axed [duISY Wied

[eow/oxe0 passury *
930 U0J100 PajedNI039pu[) *

98D U000 PIJBdNI0R_q
[esw ueaq vAOS
Jeal ysty

dind sni) -

sueaq ISNO0
doyo Auruoy
(comuBpy) vABSSED
uelg/sSullppPIN
Jeaur 30Ty



14! £C 144 9 14! SZIEN “81
61 6C 19 78 €91 S1eQ ‘LI
(174 0¢ 09 08 091 JeYM 91
81 ve 8¢ 88 LLT Asjed S|
£C 9 L8 (434 9T sead ppLY I
ve 9 811 SL1 6v¢ Sueaq ppRLy "€l
6 6 8¢ 6C LS (39m) sure1s siomarg ‘[
1 I 9 LT 39 (Nd 7 81 passaxd
s|qnop—j3am) dind 320q 1e3Ng ‘I
14 Vs [43 £el 997 | (passejow—pauip) dind 309q Je3ng Q[
€ LT 4 6¢ LL $307®10d °6
[4 6 L 0oc 14 sdiung, °g
[4 6 L 0C 14 SIpaMS “L
4 €1 L 8¢C 99 sjeSuely 9
S €C 1 LS 141! Mmeng ¢
L1 V6 9L 0€C 6Sv auldn| pauq ‘y
81 V6 €L 9Tt 1394 ssel3 poL ‘¢
91 S8 €9 £0C LoV ABY JOAC[D T
11 YL 144 ILT 1343 Aey sse1n [
d d d d d
puej ay) uo 9] puej ay3 uo 3J9|
Surpjoy a1e yorym jo sdoy ay3 sdord Suipjoy ale yoym jo sdoy a3 sdod
Sy} WOy paAOWAl | J00I JO JO SUIP|OY 2y} UO Pj | 9y} WOIJ PIAOWAI | JOOI JO IO SuIp[oY 9y} UO paj | Jjo
st Jonpoid ay pue Ind jonpoad sy} 10 pazeid st Jonpoid ayy pue Ind jonpoid sy} 10 pazeis | domw Js Suipasg
a1oym sdoio o5eioj sdoio a5ei10] 10 pue[sseIid a1oym sdoid a8e10j sdo1o a8ei10J 10 pue|sseisd ON
30 sjo01 ‘pueyssels | juoueuirad ‘K9] Jo J0 (sdo1d | 10 sj001 ‘puerssers | juouewad ‘sko Jo 10 (sdo1d
juourewiad ‘sAof Jo | afe103 3dooxs) sdo1d s[qeIe Jo | Jusuewad ‘sho] Jo | a3eiof 3daoxs) sdoid sjqeIe Jo

SUOSEaS SUIMOIT OM] I9)JY

uoseas uImoIs suo Iy

ANNO]J, ¥3d S44NLS ONIAFT] 40 SANTVA TVIINNVIA IISQVHXEAN()

L1m[S uadQ—dasys pue ssA[e) ‘o[Ie)
(©)s a1av]

10



¥STT

9L

dO %1

yoes 10§ :9)ed papunodwo) -

v

®aIn pmbry

Koym pmbry

(pmbip) Yyjiw powwnig
I pawiwinys pauq

Jesw auoq pue JBIN

Jeowr B3]l

[eowr/oxed passadey

93®5 JNUPUNOIS PAJedNI0Idq
[eaur/oxed INU0d0)D
Jeswr/axed [ouiay wied
[eaw/oxyed passury

33D U0}I0D PIYeII0PUN)
3B U01100 PAYedNI0R

jeaur uesq eLog °

Jeaur 4siy

dind snnp

sueaq JsndooY
doyo Aurwoy
(oo1ue) eABSSED

ueig/sSulppIA
Jeow S0ry

11



6y 09 86 et | &4 do %1
yord Joj :o)ed papunodwo) ST
14 L 8 ST o¢ Asym pmbry ‘pg
1 Y4 (44 0s 101 (pmby) J[Iwu powwryS €T
4 (VY4 1y 00S 666 i pawunys paLI(I "¢
oy LLy 6L8 Y56 8061 [eswr duoq pue JeS]N ‘1T
65¢ vLE 8IL 8vL S6v°T jeaur 3B “0C
161 981 €0¢ CLE SyL Jesw/o)es paosadey 61
eel L91 L9T £ee L99 932 JNUPUNOIS PaYeIRI03( 8]
L S8 14! IL1 Ive [eouI/axed [ouIsy Wied L]
9l 191 16T | 143 £v9 JeSl/a)ed Padsury 9]
cel o1 9T 6C¢ LS9 93D U03100 pajednodapu) "¢
6L1 414 86¢ (444 8 9D U03100 pajedn103e ‘[
L1I OLT 1474 6£t 6L9 Jeaw ueaq vAOS "€
543 vLE 689 8YL 96v°1 feawr gstg ‘|
€1 (174 Lz 6< 8L (corueA) eABSSED ][
$6 (74 161 6£C 6Ly uelg/sSullpPPIAL 01
39 29 901 174! 4 Jeawr 1Y “6
8¢ Ly oL V6 881 9ZIEN '8
6¥ 8¢ L6 L1 14X $180 L
6 65 86 L1l 374 jeayM "9
194 09 06 (1741 (4 Aopreq -g
9L 86 (4} 961 T6€E sead ppLy
66 9Tl L6l (44 YOS sueaq ppRIq ‘¢
6 1 X4 6l 9% 06 Se01BI0d T
9 8¢l 8¢l 9LT 1399 sse1d pau ‘[
d d d d d
pue| 3y} uo 3J9] puej[ 9y} uo 39|
Suipjoy a1e yoym jo sdoy oy sdoio Suipjoy a1e yomgm jo sdoy ay3 sdo1o
oY) WOJJ PIAOWAI | 3001 JO JO SUIP[OY oY) UO PJJ | oy} WO PIAOWI | JOOI JO 10 SUIp[oY Y3 UO paj | Jo
st jJonpoad ay3 pue 1nd j0npoid dy) 10 pazeid st 3onpoid ays pue no jonpoid ay) 10 pazeisd | doxn s Suipadg

a1oym sdoio a3eiog sdoo 95e10] JO puesseis aroym sdoxd ag8eroj sdoio 28eI10] IO pue|sseid ON

10 sjo01 ‘puessers | juoueurrad ‘s£9] Jo J0 (sdo1d | JO S)001 ‘pueyssed | jusuewndd ‘SA9 JO 10 (SdOId

jusurewriad ‘sof Jo | a5e10j 3dooxa) sdoo sjqere Jo | jusuewnrad ‘sk9f Jo | oFe1o) 3dooxs) sdoid sjqere Jo

SUOSBas SUIMOIS OM) Iy

uoseas SuIMoIs oUo 1YY

amuejy preAureJ—s31d

(p)s a1avy

ANNOJ, ¥3d SJ4NLS ONIAAd] 40 SINTVA TVIMONVIA QELSAVHXEAN()

12



T 6'¢ 08 901 I'Ic D %1
yoea 10j :9yed papunodwo) 6T
€ L L SI 0¢ Aaym pmbry "4t
9 I 0t oy 08 (pInbiy) i pawwng €7
99 611 96T w0y 708 Sf[iur pawiuiys paLI( ‘¢
(433 9LE 16L 6L8 6SL'1 Jeawr suoq pue Jed] ‘[T
99¢ €8¢ 79 9L9 TSE°T jesur JBS]N 0T
89 (1181 (344 L1g 143 Jeowr/o)ed passadey ‘61
8¢ LL 881 L9t 1235 9)ed JNUPUNOI3 pajednIoNnq ‘gl
€€ 9 4t orl 18C [eaw/o)ed [ouIsY Wied ‘L]
(39 $6 61 SLT 6v¢ Jeau/aXed PIISUIT 9|
L (yal 1914 16¢ 8¢ S¥Bd U03J0d pajesn1oepur) ‘S
88 9CI £8¢ 6S¢ 8IL 3D UOHOD pajedn1033(d ‘vl
144 LOT SL1 66C 865 Jeawr ueaq BAOS "€
65T 1{T4 619 889 LLE'T [eswr ysiy C[
L 4 12 9¢ L (cotuey) BABSSED ‘T]
€S 8 91 1414 LTy uexg/sSullppIN ‘01
LT LE V8 901 (44 Jeos Y 6
Si 9T S 6L LST 9ZIeN '8
1T €t SL 86 961 $1e0 L
€ 122 LL 66 861 Je3YM 9
1C 3¢ 0oL SoT 11¢ Aopreg S
9T (49 (118 €91 143 sead plaIg b
8¢ oL Lyl (414 (44 sueaq plaLy °¢
€ 61 14! 9% 06 $903e10d ‘T
0c 801 6 L9t ses sseid palq ‘I
d d d d d
pue| 3y} uo 1J9| pue|[ 9y} Uo 1391
Suipjoy a1e yoiym Jo sdol ay3 sdoo Suipjoy a1e yorym jo sdog ayy sdord
9y} WOIJ POAOWDI | JOOI JO 1O SuIp[oy Sy} UO paj | 2} WOIJ pasowsr | JOOI Jo Io Suipjoy 943 uo p3j | po
st Jonpoid sy} pue 0o jonpoid sy} 10 pozerd s1 3onpoad ay} pue Ind jonpoid ay} Jo pazeid | doid pnis Surpasy
a1oym sdoio a3eIoy sdoo 93e10] JO puejsseid aroym sdouo ofe1oj | sdoio oFel1o0] 10 puejsseid ON

Jo 5001 ‘puesseid
jusuewIad ‘sA9] Jo

jusueuriad ‘sAof jo 1o (sdoxd
95e10J 1dooxd) sdoid d|qeIe Jo

JO 1001 ‘puB|sseld

juouewniad ‘sk9] Jo 10 (sdoxo

jusuruLiad *sko Jo | adeIoy 3dedxs) sdoio sjqere Jo
IJ _ 3 19

SUOSESS SUIMOIS OM) TNy

uoseas SuUIMOoIS JU0 IV

Axmn[g paso]D—s3id
AMVW T1ev ],
ANNOJ ¥idd S44iNLS ONIQIHJ JO SINTIVA TVIINNVIN QaLSNVHXIAN()

13



€T Ve 89 68 8Ll dO %1
Yors J0j :9)ed papunodwio) °ST
4 S 9 (4 ST Aaym pmbry “pg
S (] 154 3% 99 (pmbi)) yjw pswwpS ‘€T
65 101 8¥C [4%3 $99 NI pawiwys paLI(T ‘7T
S6C £33 169 9L yes'l [edw duoq pue JBIN ‘1T
9¢C 0S¢ 09§ L8S SLI‘T jeaur BN 0T
19 6 661 9T (U39 Jeowr/o)es paasadey 61
143 §9 LST 0TC (3% aed Jnupunol3 paeyedn10ed 8l
67 6¢ L6 811 9¢C [eaw/o)ed [ouIey Wred °LI
Ly 08 ol 6CC LSY [eswI/oXed PIIsury ‘91
9 $6 V81 944 16¥ 93{B0 U03300 pajed1I039puf) ‘¢ 1
8L 801 1§74 0¢ 09 3Yed u03300 pajednionq ‘vi
6¢ 68 Lyl Lyt X374 [eawr ueaq BAOS "¢
0£T 8ST ovs 96¢ T61°1 [eawt Ustg [
9 4! 81 0¢ 09 (cotueN) eABSSED ‘T
Ly oL pel 081 09¢ uelg/s3ulppyA ‘0l
1 (43 w 68 6L1 Jeswr OIY °6
14! (4 6y s9 1€l o9zZIeN '8
61 8¢ €9 8 91 $180 ‘L
0c 6C €9 €8 991 JBYM 9
81 [43 09 88 SLI Aojreq ¢
€C 144 €6 SEl 69¢ sead pjord ‘¢
b 09 el 9LT (433 suesq pRlg ‘¢
€ ! 11 LE €L $903e10d ‘T
81 88 LL L1T 1454 ssexd paug ‘[
d d d d d
pue[ ay3 uo 1J9[ puej 9y} uo 1J9j
Suipjoy a1e yorgm Jo sdoy ay3 sdoxd Suipjoy a1e yorym jo sdoy oy} sdoid
o) WoIj poAowaI | 3001 Jo 10 SUIP|OY 3y} UO PAJ | SY) WOIj PIAOWSI | JOOI JO JO SuIpjoy dyY) uo paj | Jo
st 3onpoad ay3 pue nd jonpold 3y} Jo pazeid st 3onpoid oy} pue 1o jonpoid oy} Jo pazeis | dom pns Suipadg

a1oym sdod 93e10j sdouo a5e10j J0 pur|sseid a1oym sdoid a3e10j sdoxo a5e1o] 10 pue[sseId ON

10 5001 ‘pueyssels | juourwIad ‘sA9] JO IO (sdo1o | Jo sjoor ‘puesseis | Judsuewlad ‘sL9] Jo IO (sdox

juouewiIad ‘sk9] Jo | oFeioy 3dooxe) sdoo o[qere Jo | juouewiad ‘sA9] Jo | o3e1o] 3daoxa) sdoid sjqere jo

SUOSEIS SUIMO0I3 oM} J91}Y

uoseas SuIMOoIS Juo 1Y

Aum[g usdQ—s31d

(f)s aravy

ANNOJ, ¥ad SIiNLS ONIAad] 40 SANTVA TVRIONVIA QILSNVHXAN()

14



9T 8¢ LL To1 £0T dD %1
yoea I10J :9yed pepunodwio) ‘1T
(433 €LE CLL €68 LOL'T Jeawr suoq pue Je3N "0T
99¢C 78T §79 LS9 €IET [esws BN 61
89 901 LTT €0t 909 [eaw/a)es passadey ‘g1
8¢ L 181 1374 LOS a)ed JNUpPUNOI3 pajeonIod( Ll
£e 194 171 SEl 0LT [eswr/axed [auIey wied ‘9]
£S 16 981 (414 T8 [BaW/aXed Passur] ‘G
L LOL 60C 6LT 866 9Y§Ed U00D PajednIodnpuNn “pI
88 £Cl SLT 1943 169 9D U000 PajednIon( ‘¢l
44 01 (4! 9LT €58 [estu uedq BAOS 7]
6S¢ 16T £09 899 9€€’T [eaur Ysty ‘[T
L £l 174 143 89 (o01uBN) BABSSED 0T
139 08 4! 20T £0v ue1g /SSUIIPPIN '6
L7 LE 8 201 0T Jeow 201y '8
ST 4 39 €L 14! 9ZIe|N "L
x4 [43 (V3 16 €81 S1EQ 9
£T 3% L €6 ¢8Il JBIYM G
1T LE 99 86 961 Aopreq -y
9 0s 901 53 60€ sead pLy ‘¢
8¢ 89 54! 10T (44 sueaq ppLy T
(174 101 L8 8T L6y sse13 pauq [
d d d d d
pue[ 9y} uo 13| pu®[ 3y} uo 1J9|
suipjoy a1e yorym jo sdoy oyl sdosd Suipjoy aIe yoigm jo sdoj syl sdoso
5y} WOIJ PAAOWAL | JOOI JO IO SUIP[OY 9y} UO PaJ | 9Y} WOIJ PIAOWSI | JOOI JO IO SUIp[OY Y} UO p3j | o
s1 jonpoid sy} pue no jonpoid ay) 1o pazeid s1 3onpouid sy} pue 1nd jonpoud ay) 10 pazei3 | doxd pns 3uipasg

a1oym sdoio 93el0j sdoio agel10j 10 pue|sseid a1aym sdouo a3eIo) sdoo a3ei10J 10 puejsserd ON

10 53001 ‘puesseis | juourwiad ‘s£9f JO 10 (sdo1d | IO sjooi ‘puejsses | jusurwnrdd ‘sA9] Jo J0 (sdoId

jusueuLiad ‘sK9] Jo | oFe10j 3dooxa) sdoid s[qere jo | juourwriad ‘sA9[ Jo | 93eIoy 3daox9) sdoid sjqere Jo

SUOSBas uIMOoI3 oM} 1Y

uosess SUIMO0I3 JUo 1]y

Inuey prefwred—Annog

(8)g I1av]L

ANNOJ, ¥dd S4dN1S ONIQIHJ JO SINIVA TVINANV]A GILSOVHXEAN[)}

15



T o TS '8 Lel dD %1
yoea J0J :93ed popunodwo) *Ig
(433 08¢ 99 I9L YLYT Jear auoq pue Je3N ‘0T
99¢ 8T 1€S 695 oLT'1 [ealtr JBIINL 61
89 el LET LT 18 Jeaw/axed passadey ‘g1
8¢ I8 SL 191 Ly 932 INUPUNOIT PIYLONI0NJ L]
€€ Ly s9 V6 [4Y4 [ea/axed [ouIdy wied 91
€S 86 901 L6l 90§ [eaW/a)EO PAdSuI ¢
<L Vil Syl 8CC s 981 U03)0O PajediIosopuf) “y[
88 6CL SLI 8T 859 93 U03105 Payediloda( "¢l
144 (44} 68 Y44 (433 [esw ueaq vAOS “TI
65T L6T 8IS P6S 60€°1 [eswr ysty [
L Sl £l 6C 69 (oouey) BABSSED) 0T
139 S8 901 691 86¢ uelg/S3UlPPIA 6
LT 8¢ €S LL ¥61 Jeawr 31y °8
! LT It s 6¢£1 zZIeN L
|44 Ve w 89 SLY $18O 9
€ 33 94 0oL LLT jeagM ¢
|14 oy |14 08 61 fopreq -y
9 143 [43 601 $6C sead ppIg ¢
8¢ €L SL 4! 98¢ sueaq ppIq ‘T
0z 9II oy 1€C 6S sse13 pauq ‘[
d d d d d
pugj 9y) Uo 3J9f pue| ay1 uo 1J9|
Suipjoy aIe yorgm jo sdoy ay3 sdord Suipjoy are yorym jo sdoj ay3 sdoso
9y} WOIJ POAOWAI | 1001 JO 1O SuIp[oy Yl UO P | 9y} WOIJ PIAOWAI | J00I JO 10 SUIPJOY 9y} Uo paj | Jo
st jonpoid ay3 pue nd jonpoid 9} 10 pazead st jonpoud oy pue 300 3onpoid ay) 10 pazeisd | domw pnis 3urpadg
a1oym sdoio a3eIoj sdoo 98ei0] 10 pue[sseId a1oym sdoid 98e10] sdoio a8ei10j 10 puelsseId ON

JO $)001 ‘pur|sseid
jusueuLdd ‘sA9f Jo

jusueunad ‘sA3[ Jo 10 (sdoid
98e10J 1d9ox9) sdo1d 9[qeIe jJo

10 §)001 ‘pue[sseid
JusuewrIxd ‘s3| Jo

Juauewaad ‘sA9f Jo J0 (sdoxd
a3e10J 1dooxs) sdoio s[qere Jjo

SuOseas SUIMOIZ OM] ISV

uoseds SUIMOI3 U0 1Y

A1n[g paso[D—An[noJg

() aavy
INNOJ, ¥3d SJdNLS ONIQad] 40 SANIVA TYIHONVJA CQALSOVHXIN(])

16



T e Ly 6’9 L'91 dD %1
yoes I10j :9yed papunodwo) °IT
S6T 143> 06$ 899 9SH‘1 Jeawr auoq pue 1B "0C
9T 1T Ly 08 or1‘1 [eaw JBIN 61
19 L6 (44} v61 687 [eatu/axed paasadey “gi
143 89 L9 9¢1 06¢ 932 JNUPUNOI3 PaJBONIo( ‘LT
6T oy 8¢ 18 £1c Teow /a0 [ouId Wied ‘91
Ly £8 6 L91 (Y44 [eoW/a3ed PIssul] ‘S
¥9 L6 8¢l S61 (414 9YED U030 PoJEdNI03PU[) Y[
8L I 961 (444 LSS 93D U03300 pajednIoe( 't
6¢ 6 6L 881 LSY [eaw ueaq BAOS ‘TT
0£T 19¢ 09y 1 X493 6€1°1 Jesws ystg ‘[
9 cl cl Y4 LS (co1uey) BARSSED ‘O
Ly L v6 94 LEE uelg /SSUIIPPIA 6
144 133 Ly 99 S91 jeat 1Y '8
14} 1 X4 LT 9 LI1T SZIBN L
61 6C 8¢ 8¢ Lyl $I1BO 9
0z 0t or 09 0S1 JBYM S
81 e LE L9 091 Aopreq v
£C 9% 9% 6 ST sead PRI "¢
1 9 L9 4! | 143 suesq ppId T
81 V6 ot 681 oty sseIs pau( ‘I
d d d d d
pue[ dY) uo 19| puej 9y} uo 3J9]
Suipjoy aI1e yoiym jo sdoy ay3 sdosd Surpioy are yogm Jo sdoy ay3 sdoo
Y} WOIJ PaAOWaI | 300I JO IO SUIP[OY Sy} UO PaJ | 9Y} WOy PIAOWAI | JOOX JO J0 Fuipjoy 2y} uo p3j | Jo
s1 3onpoid ay3 pue nd jonpoid 9y} 10 pazeid st 3onpouad oy pue 1no jonpoad ayy Jo pazeid3 | dow pys 3uipasg

a1oym sdoid a3eioj sdoio o3eIo} IO pue|sseid a1oym sdoxo a8eiof sdoo a3eI10J 10 pue|sseId ON

10 sj001 ‘puepsse1s | jusuewrad ‘s9[ Jo J0 (sdo1d | 10 sj001 ‘puelsserd | jusuewrad ‘SA9] Jo 10 (sdox

uouewIad ‘sAof Jo | 95e10j 3dooxs) sdoid s[qere Jo | juouewiiad ‘sk9[ Jo | a8e1oj 3deoxs) sdoid sjqere jo

Suoseas SUIMOIZ oMm] 191y

uoseas SUIMOIS 9U0 1Y

K1mg uvadQ—Annog

(Ds aavy,

ANNOJ, ¥ad SJ4NLS ONIAFd] 40 SINTVA TVRINNVIA JILSNVHXAN)

17



EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Regulations.)

These regulations, which amend the Agriculture (Calculation of Value for
Compensation) Regulations 1978, substitute new Tables 2, 3, 4, 5(a), 5(b), 5(c),
5(d), 5(e), 5(f), 5(g), 5(h) and 5(j) for calculating the compensation payable in
respect of the residual manurial value of purchased manure and fertiliser and
in respect of unexhausted manurial values of feeding stuffs; these regulations
also increase the maximum amount attributable to acclimatisation, hefting or
settlement of hill sheep on hill land, and provide for an increase in values used
in the calculation of compensation for residual sod fertility. These regulations
take effect in relation to claims for compensation payable to the outgoing
tenant of an agricultural holding arising under the provisions of the Agricultural
Holdings Act 1948 in the case of tenancies which terminate on or after 1st
July 1980.

18






STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1980 No. 751

LANDLORD AND TENANT
AGRICULTURAL HOLDINGS

The Agriculture (Calculation of Value for Compensation)
(Amendment) Regulations 1980

Printed in England by Harrison & Sons (London) Ltd., and published by Her Majesty’s Stationery Office
820/31618 F62 K20 6/80
£1.50 net
ISBN 0 11 006751 7



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

