2872

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1976 No. 1077
ROAD TRAFFIC

The Motor Cars (Driving Instruction)
(Amendment) Regulations 1976

Made - - - - 8th July 1976
Laid before Parliament 9th July 1976
Coming into Operation Ist August 1976

The Secretary of State for the Environment in exercise of the powers conferred
by sections 128, 129, 131, 133 and 142 of the Road Traffic Act 1972(a), and of
all other enabling powers, hereby makes the following Regulations:—

1. These Regulations shall come into operation on Ist August 1976
and may be cited as the Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Amendment)
Regulations 1976.

2.—(1) The Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) Regulations 1969(b), as
amended(c), shall be further amended so as to have effect as if Regulation 9
(Ineligibility for submission to either part of examination within three months
after failure) were deleted, and in Regulation 11 (Fees)—

(a) in paragraph (1) for the words “five pounds’ there were substituted
the words “£15”;

(b) in paragraph (2) for the words “ten pounds” there were substituted
the words “£25”;

(¢) in paragraph (3) for the words “fifteen pounds” there were substituted
the words ““£25’;

(d) in paragraph (4) for the words “one pound” there were substituted
the words “£15”’; and

(e) in paragraph (5) for the words “fifteen pounds” there were substituted
the words “£25.

John Gilbert

Signed by authority of Minister for Transport,
the Secretary of State. Department of the Environment.

8th July 1976.

(a) 1972 c. 20. (b) S.I. 1969/85 (1969 I, p. 248).
(c¢) S.I. 1970/966,1971/351, 1973/2013 (1970 11, p. 3071; 1971 I, p. 1096; 1973 III,

p. 6935).



S.1.1976/1077 2873

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations amend the Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) Regulations
1969, as amended, so as to—

(1) delete Regulation 9 (Ineligibility for submission - to ither part of
examination of ability to give insfruction within three months of
failure), and

(2) increase the fee for—.

(a) the written part of the examination of ablhty to g1ve instruction
from £5 to £15;

(b) the practical part of the examination of ability to give instruction
from £10 to £25;

(c) an application for retention on the Register from £15 to £25;

(d) an application for a licence to give instruction from £1 to £15;
and

(e) an application for entry in the Register in the circumstances
described .in Regulation 11(5) of the Regulatlons of 1969 from
£15 to £25.

S1 1976/1077
ISBN 0-11-061077-6

L



	
	

