STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1974 No. 1667 (S.152)

EDUCATION, SCOTLAND

Perth and Kinross Educational Trust (Amendment) Scheme 1974

Made - - - - 3rd October 1974
Coming into Operation 3rd October 1974

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 118(1) and 129 of the
Education (Scotland) Act 1962(a) and section 125(2) of the said Act as substituted
by section 19 of the Education (Scotland) Act 1969(b) and all other powers
enabling him in that behalf and after—
(a) preparing a draft scheme to amend the Perth and Kinross Educational
Trust Scheme 1964
(b) carrying out the procedure specified in section 125(1) of the said Act, and
(¢) no objections or proposed amendments to the draft scheme having been
received by him,

the Secretary of State hereby makes the following scheme:—

Citation

1. This scheme may be cited as the Perth and Kinross Educational Trust
(Amendment) Scheme 1974 and the principal scheme and this scheme shall be
construed as one and may be cited as the Perth and Kinross Educational Trust
Schemes 1964 and 1974.

Interpretation

2.—(1) In this scheme unless the context otherwise requires:—
“principal scheme” means the Perth and Kinross Educational Trust
Scheme, 1964.

(2) The Interpretation Act 1889(c) applies for the interpretation of this scheme
as it applies for the interpretation of an Act of Parliament.

(3) References in this scheme to any enactment or scheme shall, except where
the context otherwise requires, be construed as references to that enactment or
scheme as amended by or under any other enactment or scheme or as contained
in any other enactment or scheme substituted for that enactment or scheme.

(4) References in this scheme to a section, schedule or column shall, except
where the context otherwise requires, be construed as references to a section of or
a schedule to this scheme or a column of such a schedule as the case may be.

?? }333 o 2} (b) 1969 c. 49,
C C. .




Augmentation of the Perth and Kinross Educational Trust

3. From and after 3rd October 1974, the endowments specified in
Schedule 1 to this scheme shall be vested in the County Council and shall be
amalgamated with the Perth and Kinross Educational Trust to be held, ad-
ministered and applied exclusively in accordance with the provisions of the prin-
cipal scheme as amended by this scheme.

Amendments to sections of the principal scheme

4, The undernoted sections of the principal scheme shall be changed as
follows:—

(a) In subsection (3) of section 18 of the principal scheme, for the figure
of “£1,000” substitute “£2,000”.

(b) The following subsection shall be inserted after subsection (4) of section
47 of the principal scheme:—

“(5) If the award of prizes is discontinued in any school mentioned in
column (5) of the said Schedule, it shall be in the power of the County Council
to expend the sum stated in column (4) opposite the name of the prize in
column (2) of the said Schedule on the promotion of projects of an educational
nature in, or for the benefit of the pupils attending, that school. Such sums
shall be additional to funds which the County Council as Education Authority
may reasonably be expected to provide. Wherever possible the projects should
be allied to the subject or department shown in column (6) of the Schedule.”

(c) Section 51 of the principal scheme shall be deleted.

Amendment to Schedule 1 to the principal scheme

5. The following amendment shall be made to Schedule 1 to the principal
scheme:—

Serial number 22, column (3):—
delete “Persons unknown” and substitute “The Heritors of Glendevon”.

Amendments to Schedule 4 to the principal scheme

6.—(1) The principal scheme shall be amended by the addition to Schedule 4
of the principal scheme of the entries in Schedule 2 to this scheme.

(2) The following amendments shall be made to Schedule 4 to the principal
scheme:—

(a) serial number 2, column (2):—
delete “Acharn” and substitute “Kenmore”;

(b) serial number 9, column (3):—
delete “£65  and substitute “£180”;

(¢) serial number 34, column (3):—
delete “£1,100 and” and substitute “£1,380 inclusive of”;

(d) serial number 36, column (3):—
delete “£435” and substitute “£535”.

2




Amendments to Schedule 6 to the principal scheme

7.—(1) The principal scheme shall be amended by the addition to Schedule 6
of the principal scheme of the entries in Schedule 3 to this scheme.

(2) The following amendments shall be made to Schedule 6 to the principal
scheme:—

(a) serial number 6, column (5):—
delete “‘Strathfillan’ an substitute “Crianlarich’;

(b) serial number 11, column (5):—
delete “Goodlyburn Junior Secondary School” and substitute “Perth
Academy (Crieff Road)”;

(c) serial number 16, column (5):—
delete “Bendochy Primary School” and substitute “the primary depart-
ment of Coupar Angus Secondary School’;

(d) serial number 17, column (5):—
delete “‘Glenshee” and substitute ‘“Blackwater”;

(e) serial number 28, column (4):—
delete ““after deducting the sum of £6”

(f) serial number 31, column (5):—
delete “‘Comrie Junior Secondary School” and substitute “Crieff Secon-
dary School”;

(g) serial number 34, column (5):—
delete ‘““the Junior School of Perth Academy and Sharp’s Institution”
and substitute “Viewlands Primary School”;

(h) serial number 38, column (5):—
delete *“‘Kilspindie” and substitute “Inchture”;

(i) serial number 39, column (5):—

delete “Buchanty Primary School” and substitute ‘“Methven Primary
School”;

(j) serial number 50, column (5):—
delete “Trinity Gask™ and substitute “Findo Gask™.

Amendments to Schedule 7 to the principal scheme

8. The following amendments shall be made to Schedule 7 to the principal
scheme:—

(1) serial number 1:—
delete the whole entry;
(2) serial number 2, column (2):—
delete “‘Strathfillan” and substitute “Crianlarich”;

(3) serial number 4:—
delete the whole entry;




(4) serial number 7:—
delete the whole entry.

(5) serial number 15:—
delete the whole entry.

Given under the seal of the Secretary of State for Scotland.

J. F. McClellan,
Assistant Secretary.

Scottish Education Department,
St. Andrew’s House,
Edinburgh.

3rd October 1974.




SCHEDULE 1

ENDOWMENTS TO WHICH THIS SCHEME RELATES

Section 3

Serial
Number Name of Endowment Designation of Founders Governing Instrument
14))] @ 3) 4
A Acham School and Schoolhouse Endow- | The Marquess of Breadalbane Letter setting forth trust purposes dated
ment 23rd July 1968
15A Debenham Prizes Fund Family of Miss Debenham Letter from Miss Christina Wanklyn setting
forth trust purposes dated 3rd June 1968
18A Stuart Fair Prize in Geography J. Stuart Fair Letter setting forth trust purposes dated
11th May 1972
18B The Mary G. Farquharson Memorial | Doctors Mary and Alexander MacDonald | Letter from Dr. Alexander F. MacDonald
Awards setting forth trust purposes dated 27th
January 1972
22A Glendochart School and Schoolhouse En- | The Marquess of Breadalbane Letter setting forth trust purposes dated 28th
dowment February 1969
23A Grandtully School Prize Fund Miss Constance S. Glen Will of Miss Constance S. Glen dated 17th
July 1952 and registered in the Court
Books of the Commissariat of Edinburgh
on 15th September 1956 and Extract of
Minute of Public Meeting held in Grand-
tully Public Hall on 26th February 1969
25A Hepburn Memorial Trophy Fund Miss Jessie Hepburn, Will of Miss Jessie Hepburn dated 14th
Bridge of Earn October 1964 and registered in the Com-
missary Court Books of Perthshire at
Perth on 4th September 1965
30A Kennedy Dux Medal Bequest John Kennedy, Pitlochry Letter from John Kennedy’s Law Agents

s;téngng forth trust purposes dated 8th July
1




Serial

Nu(T)ber Name of Endowment Designatiogsgf Founders Governing Instrument
4
31A Ann and Mary Livingston Prize Fund Miss Mary Livingston, Oban Will of Miss Mary Livingston dated 26th
June 1964 and registered in the Sheriff
Court Books of Argyllshire Commissary
Department on 17th April 1967
33A The Alexander MacDonald Memorial | Doctors Mary and Alexander MacDonald | Letter from Dr. Alexander F. MacDonald
Award setting forth trust purposes dated 27th
January 1972
33B The Charles K. MacDonald Memorial | Doctors Mary and Alexander MacDonald | Letter from Dr. Alexander F. MacDonald
Award setting forth trust purposes dated 27th
January 1972
46A T. R. Murray Dux Medal Bequest T. R. Murray, Invergowrie Will of T. R. Murray dated 24th December
1958 and Registered in the Sheriff Court
Books of Dundee on 25th May 1972
49A John Paterson Memorial Fund Mrs. Mary Paterson, Auchterarder Letter from Mrs. Mary Paterson setting forth
trust purposes dated 19th Spetmber 1968
SCHEDULE 2 Section 6
PREFERENCES
Serial Amount of
Number Beneficiaries Preference Endowments
1) 2 3)
14A Pupils attending Crianlarich and Killin Primary Schools ‘ £180 Glendochart School and Schoolhouse endowment
33A The inhabitants of the Parish of Longforgan and the £40 C. J. G. Paterson Trust

surrounding districts




SCHEDULE 3

Section 7
Prizes
Number Sum Relative
Serial Name to be 10 be Bengeficiaries Special Conditions Serial No.
Number Awarded Expended of
Annually Annually Schedule 1
@) @ 3 1G] ) 6) ¢
9A Debenham Prizes three £6 ‘ Pupils attending Kinloch Ran- ; The prizes shall be awarded in 15A
noch Primary School each of the Senior, Junior
and Infant Departments to
a pupil who has by his or her
personality contributed most
to the school during the
year
12A Stuart Fair Prize in Geography one £6 Pupils attending Perth Prize for the best senior pupil 18A
Academy in Geography
i2B The Mary G. Farquharson — £5 | Pupils attending Perth | Prize for Instrumental Music 18B
Memorial Awards Academy
14A Grandtully School Prize one £6 Pupils attending Grandtully | Prize to be awarded at the dis- 23A
Primary School cretion of the headteacher
15A Hepburn Memorial Trophy one £9 Pupils attending Bridge of Aj medal shall be awarded to 25A
Earn, Dunbarney Primary ‘The Dux pupil
School
20A Kennedy Dux Medal — £12 Pupils attending Pitlochry | A’ silver-gilt medal shall be 30A
High School awarded to the Dux pupil
and any excess income used
to provide a prize or prizes
at the head-teacher’s dis-
cretion




8 L991%0 T1 O NASI

pu dz|
¥LIOT 8N OFS 9/YIECId/bS

30y AsouonmiS 5, AR 39H Aq poysnqnd pus **pi sI9up I18pOnBIODIN Aq puEBug ur pajuLLy

. Number Sum Relative
Serial Name to be to be Beneficiaries Special Conditions Serial No.
Number Awarded Expended of
Annually Annually Schedule 1
(V) @ 3 @ o) ©) o
20B The Ann and Mary Livingstone one £12 Pupils attending Grandtully The prizeshall take the form 31A
Prize Primary School of cash and shall be awarded
to the best pupil in the top
class of the school
22A The Alexander MacDonald one £5 Pupils attending Perth | Prize for Geography 33A
Memorial Award Academy
22B The Charles K. MacDonald one £5 Pupils  attending  Perth | Prize for General Excellence 33B
Memorial Award Academy
36A T. R. Murray Dux Medal one £6 Pupils attending Invergowrie | The Medal shall be awarded to 46A.
Bequest School the Dux pupil
38A John Paterson Memorial Prize — £30 Pupils attending Auchterarder | 809 of the sum shown in 49A

Secondary School

column (4) to be used to
award sports prizes for the
younger pupils who do not
participate in the House
System and for prizes for
the Primary and Secondary
Sports Champions. The
balance to be used to award
a prize to the boy and/or
girl judged by the head-
teacher and staff to have
done most for the service of
the school and/or the Com-
munity during the school
year




