
Status: Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the
Coal Mines Act 1919 (repealed 20.11.1993). (See end of Document for details)

Coal Mines Act 1919
1919 CHAPTER 48 9 and 10 Geo 5

An Act to amend the Coal Mines Acts 1887 to 1914, with respect to the Hours of
Employment below Ground. [15th August 1919]

Commencement Information
I1 Act wholly in force at Royal Assent.

1 Reduction of hours of employment below ground.

The M1Coal Mines Regulation Act 1908, in its application to mines in which coal is
worked shall have effect subject to the following modifications—

(a) This Act shall have effect as if in subsections (1) and (2) of section one thereof
for “eight hours” there were substituted “seven hours” and as if in proviso (a)
to subsection (7) of section one thereof for “nine hours and a half” there were
substituted “eight hours” ; and . . . F1

(b) if, after the end of the year nineteen hundred and twenty, a Resolution is passed
by both Houses of Parliament that the economic position of the coal industry
is such as to allow a further reduction of working hours, then, as from the
thirteenth day of July nineteen hundred and twenty-one, the Act shall have
effect as if in subsections (1) and (2) of section one thereof for “eight hours”
there were substituted “six hours,” and as if in proviso (a) to subsection (7) of
section one thereof for “nine hours and a half” there were substituted “seven
hours”; and

(c) in proviso (a) to subsection (7) of section one thereof the word “onsetter” shall
be omitted: . . . F1

Provided that the Secretary of State, after consultation with the workmen
affected or their representatives, may, in the case of persons employed on
work which requires to be carried on continuously by day and night, allow
them to be employed below ground for not more than eight hours during any
consecutive twenty-four hours.



2 Coal Mines Act 1919 (c. 48)
Document Generated: 2023-07-08

Status: Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the
Coal Mines Act 1919 (repealed 20.11.1993). (See end of Document for details)

Textual Amendments
F1 Words repealed by Statute Law Revision Act 1927 (c. 42)

Modifications etc. (not altering text)
C1 The text of s. 1(a),(c) is in the form in which it was originally enacted: it was not reproduced in

Statutes in Force and does not reflect any amendments or repeals which may have been made prior to
1.2.1991.

Marginal Citations
M1 1908 c. 57.

2 Short title and extent.

(1) This Act may be cited as the Coal Mines Act 1919, and the Coal Mines Acts 1887 to
1914, and this Act may be cited together as the Coal Mines Act 1887 to 1919.

(2) This Act shall not extend to Ireland . . . F2

Textual Amendments
F2 Words repealed by Statute Law Revision Act 1927 (c. 42)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1927/42
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1908/57
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1927/42


Coal Mines Act 1919 (c. 48)
Document Generated: 2023-07-08

3

Status: 
Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Coal Mines Act 1919 (repealed
20.11.1993).


