
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

Game Laws (Amendment) Act 1960
1960 CHAPTER 36

5 Increase of certain penalties

(1) In section thirty of the Game Act, 1831 (which provides that a person who trespasses
on any land in the daytime in search of game shall be liable to a fine not exceeding
two pounds or, if he is one of five or more persons so trespassing, five pounds), for
the words " two pounds " there shall be substituted the words " twenty pounds ",
and for the words " five pounds " there shall be substituted the words " fifty pounds ".

(2) In section thirty-three of the said Act (which provides for a fine not exceeding two
pounds in the case of a person who, in search of game, trespasses in the daytime in any
forest, park, chase or warren belonging to Her Majesty) for the words " two pounds "
there shall be substituted the words " twenty pounds ".

(3) In section two of the Poaching Prevention Act, 1862, for the words " five pounds "
there shall be substituted the words " fifty pounds ".

(4) This section shall not apply in relation to any offence committed before the
commencement of this Act.


