
Registration Service Act 1953 (c. 37)
FIRST SCHEDULE – Consequential Amendments in other Enactments
Document Generated: 2023-08-10

1

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

S C H E D U L E S

FIRST SCHEDULE

CONSEQUENTIAL AMENDMENTS IN OTHER ENACTMENTS

D. The Marriage Act, 1949 (12, 13 & 14 Geo. 6. c. 76)
4 In subsection (6) of section twenty-seven, for the words " one shilling" there shall

be substituted the words " one shilling and sixpence ".
5 In subsection (1) of section twenty-nine for the words " five shillings " there shall

be substituted the words " seven shillings and sixpence ".
6 In subsection (6) of section thirty-one for the words " one shilling" there shall be

substituted the words " one shilling and sixpence ".
7 In subsection (5) of section thirty-two—

(a) for the words " one shilling " there shall be substituted the words " one
shilling and sixpence "; and

(b) for the words " one pound ten shillings " there shall be substituted the words
" two pounds five shillings ".

8 In subsection (6) of section forty-one for the words " three pounds" there shall be
substituted the words " four pounds ten shillings ".

9 In subsection (4) of section forty-two, for the words "three pounds" there shall be
substituted the words " four pounds ten shillings ".

10 In section fifty-one—
(a) for the words " ten shillings " there shall be substituted the words " fifteen

shillings "; and
(b) for the words " five shillings " there shall be substituted the words " seven

shillings and sixpence ".
11 In subsection (4) of section fifty-seven for the word " sixpence " there shall be

substituted the word " ninepence ".
12 In subsection (2) of section fifty-eight, the words " so that they may be most readily

seen and examined " shall be omitted.
13 In subsection (1) of section sixty-three—

(a) for the words " one shilling " in both places where they occur there shall
be substituted the words " one shilling and sixpence ";

(b) for the word " sixpence " where first occurring there shall be substituted
the word " ninepence "; and

(c) for the words "two shillings and sixpence" there shall be substituted the
words " three shillings and ninepence ".

14 In subsection (2) of section sixty-four—

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1949/76


2 Registration Service Act 1953 (c. 37)
FIRST SCHEDULE – Consequential Amendments in other Enactments

Document Generated: 2023-08-10
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(a) for the words " at all reasonable hours " there shall be substituted the
words " at any time when the register office is required to be open for the
transaction of public business ";

(b) for the words " five shillings " there shall be substituted the words " seven
shillings and sixpence ";

(c) for the words " one shilling " there shall be substituted the words " one
shilling and sixpence "; and

(d) for the words "two shillings and sixpence" there shall be substituted the
words " three shillings and ninepence ".

15 In subsection (2) of section sixty-five—
(a) for the words " between the hours of ten in the morning and four in the

afternoon of every day, except Sundays, Christmas Day and Good Friday "
there shall be substituted the words " at any time when the General Register
Office is open for that purpose ";

(b) for the words " twenty shillings " there shall be substituted the words "
thirty shillings ";

(c) for the words " one shilling " there shall be substituted the words " one
shilling and sixpence "; and

(d) for the words " two shillings and sixpence" there shall be substituted the
words " three shillings and ninepence ",


