
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Police
Reform and Social Responsibility Act 2011, Section 115. (See end of Document for details)

Police Reform and Social
Responsibility Act 2011

2011 CHAPTER 13

PART 2

LICENSING

CHAPTER 1

AMENDMENTS OF THE LICENSING ACT 2003

Temporary event notices

115 Relaxation of time limits applying to temporary event notices

(1) The Licensing Act 2003 is amended as set out in subsections (2) and (3).

(2) In section 100 (temporary event notice)—
(a) in subsection (1), for “96 hours” substitute “ 168 hours ”, and
(b) in subsection (5)(b), for “96 hours” substitute “ 168 hours ”.

(3) In section 107(5) (counter notice where permitted limits exceeded), for “15 days”
substitute “ 21 days ”.

(4) The amendments made by this section apply in relation to temporary event notices
that are given on or after the commencement of this section.

Commencement Information
I1 S. 115(1)(2) in force at 22.3.2012 for specified purposes by S.I. 2012/896, art. 2(g)
I2 S. 115(1)(2) in force at 25.4.2012 in so far as not already in force by S.I. 2012/1129, art. 2(d)
I3 S. 115(3)(4) in force at 25.4.2012 by S.I. 2012/1129, art. 2(d)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/13/section/115/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/13/section/115/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/896
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/896/article/2/g
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/13/section/115/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/13/section/115/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/1129
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/1129/article/2/d
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/13/section/115/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/13/section/115/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/1129
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/1129/article/2/d


2 Police Reform and Social Responsibility Act 2011 (c. 13)
Document Generated: 2024-04-21

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Police Reform and Social
Responsibility Act 2011, Section 115.


