
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2011, Cross Heading: Vehicle excise duty is up to date with all changes known to be in
force on or before 13 April 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been

made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Finance Act 2011
2011 CHAPTER 11

PART 1

CHARGES, RATES, ALLOWANCES ETC

Vehicle excise duty

21 VED rates for light passenger vehicles, light goods vehicles, motorcycles etc

(1) Schedule 1 to VERA 1994 (annual rates of duty) is amended as follows.

(2) In paragraph 1 (general)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (2) (vehicle not covered elsewhere in Schedule otherwise

than with engine cylinder not exceeding 1,549cc), for “£205” substitute “ £215
”, and

(b) in sub-paragraph (2A) (vehicle not covered elsewhere in Schedule with engine
cylinder capacity not exceeding 1,549cc), for “£125” substitute “ £130 ”.

(3) In paragraph 1B (graduated rates of duty for light passenger vehicles)—
(a) for the tables substitute—

“TABLE 1

RATES PAYABLE ON FIRST VEHICLE LICENCE FOR VEHICLE

CO2 emissions figure Rate
(1) (2) (3) (4)
Exceeding Not exceeding Reduced rate Standard rate
g/km g/km £ £

130 140 105 115
140 150 120 130



2 Finance Act 2011 (c. 11)
Part 1 – Charges, rates, allowances etc

Document Generated: 2024-04-13
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2011, Cross Heading: Vehicle excise duty is up to date with all changes known to be in
force on or before 13 April 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been

made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

150 165 155 165
165 175 255 265
175 185 305 315
185 200 435 445
200 225 570 580
225 255 780 790
255 990 1000

TABLE 2

RATES PAYABLE ON ANY OTHER VEHICLE LICENCE FOR VEHICLE

CO2 emissions figure Rate
(1) (2) (3) (4)
Exceeding Not exceeding Reduced rate Standard rate
g/km g/km £ £

100 110 10 20
110 120 20 30
120 130 85 95
130 140 105 115
140 150 120 130
150 165 155 165
165 175 180 190
175 185 200 210
185 200 235 245
200 225 250 260
225 255 435 445
255 450 460”;

(b) in the sentence immediately following the tables, for paragraphs (a) and (b)
substitute—

“(a) in column (3), in the last two rows, “250” were substituted
for “435” and “ 450 ”, and

(b) in column (4), in the last two rows, “260” were substituted
for “445” and “ 460 ”.”

(4) In paragraph 1J (VED rates for light goods vehicles)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£200” substitute “ £210 ”, and
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£125” substitute “ £130 ”.

(5) In paragraph 2(1) (VED rates for motorcycles)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£15” substitute “ £16 ”,



Finance Act 2011 (c. 11)
Part 1 – Charges, rates, allowances etc
Document Generated: 2024-04-13

3

Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2011, Cross Heading: Vehicle excise duty is up to date with all changes known to be in
force on or before 13 April 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been

made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

(b) in paragraph (b), for “£33” substitute “ £35 ”,
(c) in paragraph (c), for “£50” substitute “ £53 ”, and
(d) in paragraph (d), for “£70” substitute “ £74 ”.

(6) The amendments made by this section have effect in relation to licences taken out on
or after 1 April 2011.

22 VED rates for certain goods vehicles without road-friendly suspension

(1) Part 8 of Schedule 1 to VERA 1994 (rates for goods vehicles) is amended as follows.

(2) In—
(a) paragraph 9(1) (rigid vehicles exceeding 3,500 kilograms revenue weight in

case of which pollution requirements are not satisfied), and
(b) paragraph 9A(2) (rigid vehicles exceeding that weight in case of which

pollution requirements are satisfied),
after “(3)” insert “ and paragraph 11D ”.

(3) In—
(a) paragraph 11(1) (tractive units exceeding 3,500 kilograms revenue weight in

case of which pollution requirements are not satisfied), and
(b) paragraph 11A(2) (tractive units exceeding that weight in case of which

pollution requirements are satisfied),
for “paragraph 11C” substitute “ paragraphs 11C and 11D ”.

(4) In paragraph 11C(2) (tractive units between 41,000 and 44,000 kilograms revenue
weight, with 3 or more axles and used for conveyance of semi-trailers with 3 or more
axles and usable on public road in accordance with law immediately before 21 March
2000), for “The” substitute “ Subject to paragraph 11D, the ”.

(5) After paragraph 11C insert—

11D “Certain vehicles without road-friendly suspension

(1) This paragraph applies to goods vehicles which do not have road-friendly
suspension.

(2) A goods vehicle does not have road-friendly suspension if any driving axle
of the vehicle has neither—

(a) an air suspension (that is, a suspension system in which at least 75 per
cent of the spring effect is caused by an air spring), nor

(b) a suspension which is regarded as being equivalent to an air
suspension for the purposes under Annex II of Council Directive
96/53/EC.

(3) The annual rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to a rigid goods vehicle to
which this paragraph applies and which has—

(a) a revenue weight of 15,000 kilograms, and
(b) two axles,

is £238.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/european/directive/1996/0053


4 Finance Act 2011 (c. 11)
Part 1 – Charges, rates, allowances etc

Document Generated: 2024-04-13
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2011, Cross Heading: Vehicle excise duty is up to date with all changes known to be in
force on or before 13 April 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been

made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

(4) The annual rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to a rigid goods vehicle to
which this paragraph applies and which—

(a) is a vehicle with respect to which the reduced pollution requirements
are satisfied,

(b) has a revenue weight of 21,000 kilograms, and
(c) has three axles,

is £193.

(5) The annual rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to a rigid goods vehicle to
which this paragraph applies and which—

(a) is a vehicle with respect to which the reduced pollution requirements
are satisfied,

(b) has a revenue weight of not less than 23,000 kilograms but less than
26,000 kilograms, and

(c) has three axles,
is £299.

(6) The annual rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to a rigid goods vehicle to
which this paragraph applies and which—

(a) is a vehicle with respect to which the reduced pollution requirements
are satisfied,

(b) has a revenue weight of 27,000 kilograms, and
(c) has four or more axles,

is £314.

(7) The annual rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to a tractive unit to which
this paragraph applies and which has two axles and either—

(a) has a revenue weight of 25,000 kilograms, or
(b) is a vehicle with respect to which the reduced pollution requirements

are satisfied and has a revenue weight exceeding 25,000 kilograms
but less than 28,000 kilograms,

is £266.

(8) The annual rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to a tractive unit to which
this paragraph applies and which—

(a) has a revenue weight of 28,000 kilograms,
(b) has two axles, and
(c) is to draw semi-trailers with two or more axles,

is £177.

(9) The annual rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to a tractive unit to which
this paragraph applies and which—

(a) is a vehicle with respect to which the reduced pollution requirements
are satisfied,

(b) has a revenue weight of 31,000 kilograms,
(c) has two axles, and
(d) is to draw semi-trailers with two or more axles,

is £403.



Finance Act 2011 (c. 11)
Part 1 – Charges, rates, allowances etc
Document Generated: 2024-04-13

5

Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2011, Cross Heading: Vehicle excise duty is up to date with all changes known to be in
force on or before 13 April 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been

made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

(10) The annual rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to a tractive unit to which
this paragraph applies and which—

(a) is a vehicle with respect to which the reduced pollution requirements
are satisfied,

(b) has a revenue weight of 36,000 kilograms,
(c) has three axles, and
(d) is to draw semi-trailers with two or more axles,

is £394.

(11) The annual rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to a vehicle to which
paragraph 11C and this paragraph apply and which—

(a) is a vehicle with respect to which the reduced pollution requirements
are satisfied, and

(b) has a revenue weight less than 44,000 kilograms,
is £464.

(12) This paragraph does not apply to a vehicle for which the annual rate of duty
is determined under paragraph 9(2) or 11(2).”

(6) The amendments made by this section have effect in relation to licences taken out on
or after 1 April 2011.



6 Finance Act 2011 (c. 11)
Document Generated: 2024-04-13

Changes to legislation: 
Finance Act 2011, Cross Heading: Vehicle excise duty is up to date with all changes known to be
in force on or before 13 April 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future
date. Changes that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Act associated Parts and Chapters:
Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Act (including any effects on those
provisions):
– Sch. 23 para. 45(1)(ia) inserted by 2017 c. 10 Sch. 11 para. 6(3)
– Sch. 23 para. 2(1A) inserted by S.I. 2019/397 reg. 2(2) (This amendment not applied

to legislation.gvo.uk. Amending Regulations revoked on IP completion day by S.I.
2020/1544, regs. 1, 8; S.I. 2020/1641, reg. 2, Sch.)

– Sch. 23 para. 15A inserted by S.I. 2019/397 reg. 2(3) (This amendment not applied
to legislation.gvo.uk. Amending Regulations revoked on IP completion day by S.I.
2020/1544, regs. 1, 8; S.I. 2020/1641, reg. 2, Sch.)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/10/schedule/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/10/schedule/11/paragraph/6/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/397
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/397/regulation/2/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/397
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/397/regulation/2/3

