
Changes to legislation: Welfare Reform Act 2009, Section 28 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 11 May 2023. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been made

appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Welfare Reform Act 2009
2009 CHAPTER 24

PART 1

SOCIAL SECURITY

Pilot schemes

28 Period for which pilot schemes have effect etc.

(1) In section 29 of the Jobseekers Act 1995 (c. 18) (pilot schemes)—
(a) in subsection (1), for “12 months” substitute “ 36 months ”, and
(b) in subsection (8), for the words from “facilitate” to the end substitute “ make

it more likely that persons will obtain or remain in work or be able to do so ”.

(2) In section 19(1) of the Welfare Reform Act 2007 (c. 5) (pilot schemes), for “24
months” substitute “ 36 months ”.



2 Welfare Reform Act 2009 (c. 24)
Document Generated: 2023-05-11

Changes to legislation: 
Welfare Reform Act 2009, Section 28 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 11 May 2023. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes
that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Act associated Parts and Chapters:
Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Act (including any effects on those
provisions):
– Sch. 4 para. 9(3)(b) repealed by 2009 c. 24 Sch. 7 Pt. 1

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2009/24
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2009/24/schedule/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2009/24/schedule/7/part/1

