Serious Organised Crime and Police Act 2005 (c. 15) 1
SCHEDULE 16 — Remaining minor and consequential amendments (search warrants)
Document Generated: 2024-01-23
Changes to legislation: Serious Organised Crime and Police Act 2005, Cross Heading: Copyright, Designs
and Patents Act 1988 (c. 48) is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or before 23 January 2024.
There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been made appear in
the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

SCHEDULES

SCHEDULE 16

REMAINING MINOR AND CONSEQUENTIAL AMENDMENTS (SEARCH WARRANTS)

Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 (c. 48)
6 (1) The Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 is amended as follows.

(2) In section 109 (search warrants), in subsection (3)(b), for “28 days” substitute “ three
months ”.

(3) In section 200 (search warrants), in subsection (3)(b), for “28 days” substitute “ three
months ”.

(4) In section 297B (search warrants), in subsection (3)(b), for “28 days” substitute “
three months .

Commencement Information
11 Sch. 16 para. 6 in force at 1.1.2006 by S.I. 2005/3495, art. 2(1)(s)


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2005/15/schedule/16/paragraph/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/3495
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/3495/article/2/1/s

Serious Organised Crime and Police Act 2005 (c. 15)
Document Generated: 2024-01-23

Changes to legislation:

Serious Organised Crime and Police Act 2005, Cross Heading: Copyright, Designs and Patents
Act 1988 (c. 48) is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or before 23 January
2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been
made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.

View outstanding changes

Commencement Orders yet to be applied to the Serious Organised Crime and Police
Act 2005
Commencement Orders bringing provisions within this Act into force:

- S.I. 2006/2182 art. 3 amendment to earlier commencing SI 2006/1871



http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/2182
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/2182/article/3

