
Criminal Justice Act 1991 (c. 53)
SCHEDULE 8 – Amendments for Treating Persons Aged 17 as Young Persons
Document Generated: 2024-01-19

1

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

S C H E D U L E S

SCHEDULE 8 Section 68.

AMENDMENTS FOR TREATING PERSONS AGED 17 AS YOUNG PERSONS

Children and Young Persons Act 1933 (c. 12)
1 (1) Section 31 of the 1933 Act shall be renumbered as subsection (1) of that section

and after that provision as so renumbered there shall be inserted the following
subsection—

“(2) In this section and section 34 of this Act, “young person” means a person
who has attained the age of fourteen and is under the age of seventeen years.”

(2) In sections 46(1) and (1A), 48(2) and 99(1) of that Act, for the words “the age of
seventeen” there shall be substituted the words “the age of eighteen”.

(3) In section 107(1) of that Act, for the definition of “young person” there shall be
substituted the following definition—

““young person” means a person who has attained the age of fourteen and
is under the age of eighteen years.”

Prison Act 1952 (c. 52)
2 In section 43(3) of the 1952 Act (remand centres, young offender institutions etc.),

for the words “aged 17 years” there shall be substituted the words “aged 18 years”.

Children and Young Persons Act 1963 (c. 37)
3 In section 29(1) of the Children and Young Persons Act 1963, for the words “the

age of seventeen” there shall be substituted the words “the age of eighteen”.

Children and Young Persons Act 1969 (c. 54)
4 (1) Section 29 of the 1969 Act shall be renumbered as subsection (1) of that section

and after that provision as so renumbered there shall be inserted the following
subsection—

“(2) In this section “young person” means a person who has attained the age of
fourteen and is under the age of seventeen years.”

(2) In section 70(1) of that Act, for the definition of “young person” there shall be
substituted the following definition—

““young person” means a person who has attained the age of fourteen and
is under the age of eighteen years;”.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1933/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1952/52
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1963/37
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1969/54


2 Criminal Justice Act 1991 (c. 53)
SCHEDULE 8 – Amendments for Treating Persons Aged 17 as Young Persons

Document Generated: 2024-01-19
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

Rehabilitation of Offenders Act 1974 (c. 53)
5 In section 5(2) of the Rehabilitation of Offenders Act 1974 (which provides for

rehabilitation periods to be reduced by half for young offenders)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for the words “seventeen years of age” there shall be

substituted the words “eighteen years of age”; and
(b) in the heading to Table A, for the words “under 17” there shall be

substituted the words “under 18”.

Magistrates' Courts Act 1980 (c. 43)
6 (1) Part I of the 1980 Act (criminal jurisdiction and procedure) shall be amended as

follows—
(a) for the words “the age of 17”, in each place where they occur, there shall be

substituted the words “the age of 18 years”;
(b) in section 22(9), for the words “under 17” there shall be substituted the words

“under 18”;
(c) in section 36(1), for the words “17 years of age” there shall be substituted

the words “18 years of age”; and
(d) in section 38 for the words “17 years old” there shall be substituted the words

“18 years old”.

(2) In section 81(1), (3) and (8) of that Act, for the words “the age of 17” there shall be
substituted the words “the age of 18”.

(3) In sections 96A, 135(3) and 136(4) of that Act, for the words “aged 17” there shall
be substituted the words “aged 18”.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/53
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1980/43

