Status: This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

Finance Act 1985

1985 CHAPTER 54

PART I

CUSTOMS AND EXCISE AND VALUE ADDED TAX

CHAPTER 1

CUSTOMS AND EXCISE
The rates of duty

Spirits, beer, wine, made-wine and cider

(1) In section 5 of the Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 (excise duty on spirits) for
"£15.48" there shall be substituted " £15.77".

(2) In section 36 of that Act (excise duty on beer) for "£24.00" and "£0.80" there shall be
substituted " £25.80 " and " £0.86 " respectively.

(3) For the Table of rates of duty in Schedule 1 to that Act (wine and made-wine) there
shall be substituted the Table in Schedule 1 to this Act.

(4) With respect to wine or made-wine imported into or produced in the United Kingdom
on or after 29th July 1985, Schedule 1 to this Act shall have effect with the
substitution—

(a) for the words " of less than 15 ", in each place where they occur, of the words
" not exceeding 15 "; and

(b) for the words " of not less than 15 " of the words " exceeding 15 ".

(5) In section 62(1) of that Act (excise duty on cider) for "£14.28 " there shall be
substituted " £15.80".

(6) This section and Schedule 1 to this Act shall be deemed to have come into force on
20th March 1985.



2 Finance Act 1985 (c. 54)
PART I — Customs and Excise and Value Added Tax
CHAPTER I — Customs and Excise
Document Generated: 2023-05-19
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).
2 Tobacco products

(1) For the Table in Schedule 1 to the Tobacco Products Duty Act 1979 there shall be

substituted—

“TABLE

1. Cigarettes

2. Cigars
3. Hand-rolling tobacco

4. Other smoking tobacco and chewing
tobacco.

An amount equal to 21 per cent, of the retail
price plus £26-95 per thousand cigarettes.

£47-05 per kilogram.
£43-73 per kilogram.
£24-95 per kilogram.”

(2) This section shall be deemed to have come into force on 22nd March 1985.

Hydrocarbon oil

(1) In section 6(1) of the Hydrocarbon Oil Duties Act 1979 (rates of duty on hydrocarbon
oil) for " £0.1716 " (light oil) and " £0.1448 " (heavy oil) there shall be substituted "
£0.1794 " and " £0.1515 " respectively.

(2) This section shall be deemed to have come into force at 6 o'clock in the evening of
19th March 1985.

Vehicles excise duty

(1) The Vehicles (Excise) Act 1971 and the Vehicles (Excise) Act (Northern Ireland) 1972
shall be amended as follows.

(2) For the provisions of Part II of Schedules 1 to 5 to each of those Acts (annual rates of
duty) there shall be substituted the provisions set out in Part I of Schedule 2 to this Act.

(3) The provisions of Part I of Schedule 4 to each of those Acts (annual rates of duty on
goods vehicles: general provisions) shall have effect subject to the amendments made
by Part II of Schedule 2 to this Act.

(4) In section 2(1)(b) of each of those Acts (six month licence for vehicles with annual
rate exceeding £18) for " £18 " there shall be substituted " £35".

(5) In section 16 of the Act of 1971 (rates of duty for trade licences) in subsection (5),
including that subsection as set out in paragraph 12 of Part I of Schedule 7 to that Act,
for " £44" there shall be substituted " £46".

(6) In section 16 of the Act of 1972 (rates of duty for trade licences) in subsection (6),
including that subsection as set out in paragraph 12 of Part I of Schedule 9 to that Act,
for " £44 " there shall be substituted " £46".

(7) In the heading of Schedule 1 to each of those Acts and in paragraph 1 of Part I of
each of those Schedules (annual rates of duty on certain vehicles not exceeding 425
kilograms) for " 425 KG." and " 425 kilograms " there shall be substituted respectively
"450KG. " and " 450 kilograms ".

(8) This section applies in relation to licences taken out after 19th March 1985.



