
Changes to legislation: Representation of the People Act 1985, Cross Heading: Deposits and expenses
at elections is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or before 19 April 2024. There are
changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been made appear in the

content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Representation of the People Act 1985
1985 CHAPTER 50

Deposits and expenses at elections

13 Deposit by candidates at parliamentary elections.

In Schedule 1 to the principal Act (parliamentary elections rules)—
(a) in rule 9(1) (nomination not valid unless £150 deposited with the returning

officer) for “£150” there shall be substituted “£500”; and
(b) in rule 53(4) (forfeiture of deposit where a candidate has polled not more than

one-eighth of the total votes) for “one-eighth” there shall be substituted “one-
twentieth”.

14 Election expenses.

(1) In section 73(2) of the principal Act (payments made by election agent to be vouched
for by bill and receipt except where less than £2) for “£2” there shall be substituted
“£20”.

(2) In section 74(1) of that Act (candidate’s personal election expenses may be met by
him if they do not exceed £100, the excess being paid by his election agent) for “£100”
there shall be substituted “£600”.

F1(3) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
F1(4) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
F1(5) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

(6) In paragraph 3 of Schedule 4 to that Act (candidates at elections of parish or
community councillors to send in return of all election expenses vouched, except
where less than £1, by bills and receipts) for “£1” there shall be substituted “£10”.



2 Representation of the People Act 1985 (c. 50)
Document Generated: 2024-04-19

Changes to legislation: Representation of the People Act 1985, Cross Heading: Deposits and expenses
at elections is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or before 19 April 2024. There are
changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been made appear in the

content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Textual Amendments
F1 S. 14(3)-(5) repealed (16.2.2001) by 2000 c. 41, s. 158(2), Sch. 22 (with s. 156(6)); S.I. 2001/222, art.

2 Sch. 1 Pt. I (subject to transitional provisions in Sch. Pt. II)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1985/50/section/14/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/41
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/41/section/158/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/41/schedule/22
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/41/section/156/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/222
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/222/article/2/schedule/1/part/I
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/222/article/2/schedule/1/part/I
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/222/schedule/part/II


Representation of the People Act 1985 (c. 50)
Document Generated: 2024-04-19

3

Changes to legislation: 
Representation of the People Act 1985, Cross Heading: Deposits and expenses at elections is up
to date with all changes known to be in force on or before 19 April 2024. There are changes that
may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been made appear in the content
and are referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Act associated Parts and Chapters:
Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Act (including any effects on those
provisions):
– s. 15(1)(d)(e) inserted by 2012 c. 11 s. 2(2)(b)
– s. 15(3ZA) inserted by 2012 c. 11 s. 2(4)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2012/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2012/11/section/2/2/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2012/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2012/11/section/2/4

