Draft Regulations laid before Parliament under 7(3) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’
Compensation) Act 1979, for approval by resolution of each House of Parliament.

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. XXXX
SOCIAL SECURITY

The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers” Compensation) (Payment of
Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2020

Made - - - - HE

Coming into force - - Ist April 2020

The Secretary of State for Work and Pensions makes the following Regulations, in exercise of the
powers conferred by sections 1(1), (2) and (4) and 7(1) and (2) of the Pneumoconiosis etc.
(Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979(a).

In accordance with section 7(3)(b) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act
1979, a draft of this instrument was laid before, and approved by, a resolution of each House of
Parliament.

Citation, commencement and application
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
(Payment of Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2020 and come into force on 1st April 2020.

(2) These Regulations apply only in relation to any case in which a person first fulfils the
conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’” Compensation)
Act 1979 on or after 1st April 2020.

Amendment of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988

2.—(1) The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims) Regulations
1988(c) are amended as follows.

(2) In the proviso to regulation 5(1) (payment where death results from diffuse mesothelioma)
for “£3,250” substitute “£3,305”.

(3) In regulation 6(1)(a) (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by tuberculosis) for
“£6,724” (in both places) substitute “£6,838”.

(4) In regulation 8 (minimum amount payable to dependant) for £3,250” substitute “£3,305.
(5) In the Schedule—

(a) 1979 c. 41. Section 1 was amended by section 24 of the Social Security Act 1985 (c. 53).
(b) Section 7(3) was amended by section 58 of the Welfare Reform Act 2007 (c. 5).
(c) S.I. 1988/668; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1989/552, 2015/503, S.1. 2019/412.



(a) in the part headed “TABLE 17, for the table after the preamble substitute—



€6E6E 1€S°LE 87C°GE LEEEE TL6°0E 1T¥°8¢ 165°CC T8l 86C°¢l 89¥°L 19
60y 0LTTY 0r¢or 607°8¢ 786°S¢ 191°¢€ L0OS 9T CE9°'IT 0ITST 8€€°8 09
[44:%'1% Y00°LY 160°S 980°¢ct 066°0% €68°LE LTV 0€ 0S0°ST YCI'L] 661°6 65
195°€S 6€L1S LL8'6V 196°LY ¥00°91 1€9°Cy LEETE [L¥°8C 0r0°61 790°01 8¢
96T°8¢ 18%°9¢ 099°%S €€8°CS €10°1S LLE LY 8GT'8¢ G88°I¢ 6v6°0C 7601 LS
LIT09 96785 18%°9¢ 099°vS £€8°CS Sss'61 118°0¥ 86L1¢ 8TTET 1ST°CI 9¢
8v6°19 LIT09 967°8S 18¥°9¢ 099°vS 8ELIS 6SEeY OIL'LE 805°ST 9LS €1 Y
99L°¢9 8619 LIT09 96785 18¥°9¢ 976°¢S L16°SY SToov C8LLT €681 123
G869 99L°€9 87619 LIT09 96785 CII9S 97 81 ovs‘ey $90°0¢ €1T91 €S
SO¥°L9 G85°69 99L°¢9 8619 LIT09 96T°8¢ TI0°1S 8SYOF LEETE CES'LT [4Y
796°69 6£1°89 TIe99 T1S¥9 vL9°T9 ¥8¥°09 976°¢S 69¢°81 v19°¢€e 817681 IS
01SCL 989°0L 998°89 LYO'LY 12T°S9 ¥L9°C9 89S 0T€08 068 6S€°0C 0S
S90°SL IvTeL 8IVIL S65°69 TLL'LY 79819 LSL'6S 861°CS ¥91°9¢ CTLLIT (Y4
SI9°LL 98L°GL 696°¢CL 8Y1°TL 12€0L LY0°L9 vL9°T9 [48%S Ob¥'LE ¥81°¢T 81
191°08 0ve 8L 12S9L €69'VL 6L8TL £T°69 G86°69 020°9¢ YIL8E 865 1T Ly
TLOTS OvT6L TEV'LL 809°GCL 68L€EL 60S°0L LYO°LY LEV'8S S06°'1¥ 9€T°9C 9%
¥86°18 191°08 0vE'8L 12S9L €69'VL C8LIL 20589 87809 160°SY 9L8°LT 9%
768°C8 TLOT8 VT 6L CEV'LL 809°GCL 8S0°EL 796°69 097°€9 6LT°8Y 115°6C 144
808°¢c8 78618 191°08 0ve 8L 12S9L SEEVL 8IVIL 6L9°G9 Sov1S CCII¢E 13917
OILV8 7688 TLOTS OvT6L TEV'LL 809°GCL 6L8TL 160°89 099°vS L8LTE (4%
8€608 OILV8 76878 TLOTI8 OvT6L TEV'LL 08LVL 60S°0L 68€°LS L88°€EE 184
79¢°88 8€5°98 OIL¥8 7688 TLOT8 VT 6L 869°9L 616TL LIT09 186°1€ oy
781°06 09¢°88 8€608 OILV8 ¥$9C8 CLOT8 v19°8L €EECL €68°79 1L0°9¢ 6¢
€006 781°06 09¢°88 8€6°98 OILV8 76878 67508 LYLLL G86°69 YO1°LE 8¢
LT8°€6 €00°C6 781°06 09¢°88 8€5°98 OILV8 I¥°C8 191°08 €7€°89 8GC'8¢ | Iopun.lio /¢
F F F F F F F F F F
%001 - %06~ %08~ WOL~ %09- %OS- %Ot~ WOE- WOC- 4opun 40
BI6 WIS WBIL W19 WIS BIY WIE BIT BIT WOl uosiad
pa1qosip
poriad juvaajad ayj 40f JudUISSISSD ISDIUIILIJ Jo a3y,




" 8LSP1 960°€1 9L0°C1 16501 801°6 ¥80°8 192°9 786°¢ €SSy Soge 19A0 10 [/,
080°G1 SPeel 91Tl 02801 0rE'6 61C°8 66£9 0L9°S €r9'y €6€°¢ 9L
vLSCT 9001 66LC1 SYO'IT S9¢°6 96€'8 ¢es9 €9L°S IvLY L8Y'E SL
990°91 19771 991°¢1 SLTTI 16L°6 8678 SL9'9 €S8°S 8T8y 9LS°€E YL
6L591 81671 6CS°€l 10S°T1 TTool 6298 0189 SY6°S 126v €99°¢ €L
¥80°L1 69¢°S1 168°€1 9TL 11 1ST°01 89L°8 LY6°9 S€0’9 010°¢ 6SL°¢ L
€LY°LT rr6°Sl Y61 10€°C1 8¥L°01 1€1°6 LOE'L 989 061°S €L8°E IL
99T°81 60591 €68 71 0L8°C1 9T 11 6676 9L9°L ¢ec9 8LE'S ¢86°¢ 0L
76881 ¥80°LI €6£°C1 ovrel TSLTI $98°6 0t0°8 68L°9 LSS'S 001 69
8161 LY9'LT L68°SI 9001 16T°C1 8TC01 LOV'8 LEO'L €eL'S 01Tt 89
00T T8l S6£91 8LS VI LSLTI 165°01 89L°8 S8T'L 126°S 6CEY L9
966°CC veIIe Y961 €SELT €6£°CI 01T¢l 8¥L01 06L°8 910°L S8LY 99
TLY'ST 160'¥C LETTT Teroe 9€0°81 1€8°C1 €eLTI €62°01 801°8 ovT's S9
T8L'8T 096°9C 900°ST T16TC 089°0C vr'81 0ILY1 96L°T1 661°6 €0L’S 9
00L°T¢ LL8'6C 9L8°LT 889°CC 91¢°€T 690°1¢ 96991 86C°¢l €62°01 6¥1°9 €9
L19°Y€ L8LTE LYLO€ 1L¥'8C 196°ST 689°€T TLY'8I €081 98¢°11 €09°9 9




(b) in the part headed “TABLE 2”, for the table after the preamble substitute—

“Part A
Age of Percentage assessment for the relevant period
disabled
person on 10% 11%-20% 21%-30% 31%-49% 50% or over
th-eir last or under £ £ £ £ £
birthday
before their
death
37 or under 24,232 41,316 46,324 47,693 48,829
38 23,686 39,765 44,955 46,324 47,779
39 23,141 38,217 43,590 44,954 46,731
40 22,590 36,665 42,223 43,590 45,685
41 22,044 35,118 40,857 42,223 44,637
42 21,502 33,575 39,489 40,857 43,590
43 20,516 31,569 38,259 39,625 42,587
44 19,539 29,558 37,026 38,398 41,576
45 18,561 27,556 35,798 37,166 40,580
46 17,580 25,550 34,463 35,936 39,579
47 16,602 23,547 33,344 34,711 38,579
48 15,853 22,999 32,434 33,753 37,349
49 15,096 22,452 31,519 32,796 36,116
50 14,347 21,905 30,611 31,834 34,889
51 13,597 21,360 29,700 30,884 33,663
52 12,846 20,816 28,788 29,926 32,434
53 12,501 19,539 27,060 28,604 31,426
54 12,160 18,263 25,324 27,284 30,428
55 11,821 16,987 23,594 25,964 29,426
56 11,480 15,712 21,862 24,645 28,417
57 10,932 14,441 20,132 23,321 27,418
58 10,064 13,525 18,154 21,002 24,645
59 9,199 12,613 16,173 18,674 21,862
60 8,338 11,709 14,187 16,352 19,087
61 7,468 10,794 12,209 14,030 16,307
62 6,603 9,888 10,224 11,709 13,525
63 6,149 9,817 10,093 11,270 12,731
64 5,703 9,199 9,949 10,840 11,943
65 5,240 8,108 9,817 10,406 11,135
66 4,785 7,016 8,790 9,975 10,340
67 or over 3,305 4,553 5,582 6,261 8,084
Part B
Age of disabled person on their last birthday | Payment £
before their death
37 or under 48,829
38 47,7179
39 46,731
40 45,685
41 44,637




42 43,590
43 42,587
44 41,576
45 40,580
46 39,579
47 38,579
48 37,349
49 36,116
50 34,889
51 33,663
52 32,434
53 31,426
54 30,428
55 29,426
56 28,417
57 27,418
58 24,645
59 21,862
60 19,087
61 16,307
62 13,525
63 12,731
64 11,943
65 11,135
66 10,340
67 or over 8,084,

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Work and Pensions

Name
Minister of State
Date Department for Work and Pensions

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

Under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979 (c. 41) (“the Act”) lump sum
payments may be made to certain persons disabled by a disease to which the Act applies, or to
dependants of persons who were so disabled before they died. The diseases to which the Act
applies are pneumoconiosis, byssinosis, diffuse mesothelioma, primary carcinoma of the lung
(where accompanied by asbestosis or diffuse pleural thickening) and diffuse pleural thickening.

These Regulations amend the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988 (S.I. 1988/668) (“the 1988 Regulations”). The amendments made by regulation
2 have the effect of increasing the amounts payable under the 1988 Regulations. The increase in
each case is 1.7 per cent rounded up or down to the nearest £1 as appropriate.

By virtue of regulation 1(2), the amendments made by these Regulations apply only in relation to
any case in which a person first fulfils the conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Act on
or after 1st April 2020.

A full impact assessment has not been produced for this instrument as no, or no significant, impact
on the private, voluntary or public sector is foreseen.




© Crown copyright 2020

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Jeff James,
Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.



ISBN 978-0-11-119211-5

£6.90
UK202001151010 01/2020 19585
http://www legislation.gov.uk/id/ukdsi/2020/9780111192115

97780111%192115




