
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation and has not yet been made as a UK Statutory Instrument. This
draft has been replaced by a new draft, The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2013 ISBN 978-0-11-153359-8

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2012 No.

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2012

PART 2
SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS AND PENSIONS

Rates of bereavement benefits

16. In the Rate of Bereavement Benefits Regulations 2010(1)—
(a) in regulation 2 (rate of widowed mother’s allowance and widow’s pension) for “£100.70”

substitute “£105.95”; and
(b) in regulation 3 (rate of widowed parent’s allowance and bereavement allowance) for

“£100.70” substitute “£105.95”.

(1) S.I. 2010/2818.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/2818

