
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation and has not yet been made as a UK Statutory Instrument.

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2003 No.

The Release of Short-Term Prisoners on Licence
(Amendment of Requisite Period) Order 2003

Requisite period

3.—(1)  In section 34A(4)(b) of the Criminal Justice Act 1991(1), for “twelve months” there is
substituted “eighteen months”.

(2)  In section 34A(4)(c) of that Act(2), for “twelve months” there is substituted “eighteen
months”, and for “90 days” there is substituted “135 days”.

(1) Section 34A(4)(b) was amended by article 2(1) of S.I.2002/2933.
(2) Section 34A(4)(c) was amended by article 2(2) of S.I. 2002/2933.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/2933
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/2933

