
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 144

The St Mary’s Music School (Aided Places)
(Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2019

Amendments relating to clothing grants

6.—(1)  Schedule 1, part 3, paragraph 16 (clothing grants) of the 2015 Regulations is amended
as follows.

(2)  In sub-paragraph (3), for “£16,610” substitute “£17,844”, and for the table substitute—

“(1) (2)
Relevant income Maximum amount of clothing grant

Does not exceed £15,667 £272

Exceeds £15,667 but does not exceed £16,398 £203

Exceeds £16,398 but does not exceed £17,100 £134

Exceeds £17,100 but does not exceed £17,844 £67”.

(3)  In sub-paragraph (5), for “£15,917” substitute “£17,100”, and for the table substitute—

“(1) (2)
Relevant income Maximum amount of clothing grant

Does not exceed £15,897 £105

Exceeds £15,897 but does not exceed £17,100 £56”.


