
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 144

The St Mary’s Music School (Aided Places)
(Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2019

Amendments relating to the calculation of income

3.—(1)  Schedule 1, part 2, paragraph 9 (income) of the 2015 Regulations is amended as follows.
(2)  In sub-paragraph (2), in the definition of “total income”, head (a)(i), after “Chapter 3” insert

“of Part 6”.
(3)  In sub-paragraph (3), for “£1,908” substitute “£2,050”.
(4)  In sub-paragraph (4)(b), for “£1,908” substitute “£2,050”.


