Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2018 No. 69

The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2018

PART 2
Amendment of the Council Tax Reduction (Scotland) Regulations 2012

2. The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland) Regulations 2012(1) are amended in accordance with
regulations 3 to 10.

Calculation of income for persons who have an award of universal credit

3. For regulation 26 (calculation of income and capital: persons who have an award of universal
credit) substitute—

“Calculation of income and capital: persons who have an award of universal credit

26.—(1) Where an applicant or an applicant’s partner has, or the partners jointly have, an
award of universal credit, in determining the income of the applicant, the relevant authority
must use either—

(a) the calculation or estimate of the income of the applicant, the applicant’s partner
or the partners jointly (as the case may be), made by the Secretary of State for the
purpose of determining that award; or

(b) where the income of the applicant, the applicant’s partner or the partners jointly
(as the case may be) is subject to frequent change during a period of entitlement
to council tax reduction, an estimate of the income of that person or persons over
a period that is appropriate to allow the average weekly income to be estimated
accurately but the length of the period is not in any case to exceed 52 weeks.

(2) For the purposes of paragraph (1), any deduction made from an award of universal
credit for payment to a third party must be regarded as income of the person or persons
awarded universal credit.

(3) If the local authority uses the figure for income provided by the Secretary of State
under paragraph (1)(a) it must convert that figure into a weekly amount using the adjustment
set out in regulation 23(2A)(a) and must then modify the weekly amount to take into
account—

(a) as income, the amount of any universal credit payable converted into a weekly
amount using the adjustment set out in regulation 23(2A)(a); and

(b) regulation 25 (circumstances in which capital and income of non-dependant is to
be treated as applicant’s) if the relevant authority determines that the provision
applies in the applicant’s case.

(1) S.S.I. 2012/303; relevant amending instruments are S.S.I1. 2013/48, S.S.I. 2013/142, S.S.1. 2014/35, S.S.I. 2015/46, S.S.I.
2016/81 and S.S.1. 2017/41.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2012/303
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/48
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/142
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2014/35
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2015/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/81
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/81
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/41

Document Generated: 2023-10-22

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

(4) If the local authority uses the figure for income estimated in accordance with
paragraph (1)(b) it must modify that amount to take into account—

(a) asincome, the estimate of the universal credit payable made under paragraph (5),
converted into a weekly amount using the adjustment set out in regulation 23(2A)
(a); and

(b) regulation 25 if the relevant authority determines that the provision applies in the
applicant’s case.

(5) For the purpose of paragraph (4)(a) the universal credit payable must be estimated
by the local authority with reference to the figure for income estimated in accordance with
paragraph (1)(b).

(6) Where an applicant or an applicant’s partner has, or the partners jointly have, an
award of universal credit, in determining the capital of the applicant, the applicant’s partner
or the partners jointly (as the case may be), the relevant authority must use the calculation or
estimate of the capital of the applicant, the applicant’s partner, or the partners jointly (as the
case may be) made by the Secretary of State for the purpose of determining that award.”.

Payments made by the Thalidomide Trust

4. In regulation 2(1) (interpretation) after the definition of “subsistence allowance” insert—

““the Thalidomide Trust” means the registered charity of that name (number 266220)
established for the purpose of giving relief and assistance to disabled persons whose
disabilities were caused by the fact that their mother had taken a preparation containing the
drug known as Thalidomide during pregnancy;”.

5. In regulation 67(9)(2) (non-dependant deductions)—
(a) after paragraph (b) omit “and”; and
(b) after paragraph (c) insert—

113

;and

(d) any payment made under or by the Thalidomide Trust”.

6. In schedule 5 (capital to be disregarded), after paragraph 65 insert—

“66. Any payment made under or by the Thalidomide Trust.”.

Backdating of claims

7. In regulation 85(8)(b) and (c) (date on which an application is made)(3) for “one month”

substitute “6 months”.

Uprating

8. In regulation 67 (non-dependant deductions)(4)—
(a) in paragraph (1)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£11.90” substitute “£12.25”; and
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£3.95” substitute “£4.05”;

(b) in paragraph (2)—

2
3
“

Regulation 67(9) is amended by S.S.I. 2013/142, S.S.12016/81 and S.S.12017/41.

Regulation 85(8)(b) and (c) is relevantly amended by S.S.12016/81.

Regulation 67 is relevantly amended by S.S.I. 2013/48, S.S.1. 2013/142, S.S.I. 2014/35, S.S.I. 2015/46, S.S.I. 2016/81 and
S.S.1.2017/41.

2


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/142
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/142
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/41
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/81
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/48
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/142
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2014/35
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2015/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/81
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/41

Document Generated: 2023-10-22
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£200.00” substitute “£204.00;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b) for—
(aa) “£200.00” substitute “£204.00”;
(bb) “£346.00” substitute “£354.00”; and
(cc) “£7.85” substitute “£8.10”; and
(iii) in sub-paragraph (c) for—
(aa) “£346.00” substitute “£354.00”;
(bb) “£430.00” substitute “£439.00”; and
(cc) “£9.95” substitute “£10.25”.

9. In schedule 1 (applicable amount)(5)—
(a) in the table in paragraph 17 (amounts of disability premiums), in the entry—
(1) “Disability premium” for—
(aa) “£32.55” substitute “£33.55”; and
(bb) “£46.40” substitute “£47.80”;
(i1) “Severe disability premium” for—
(aa) “£62.45” in both places where it occurs substitute “£64.30”; and
(bb) “£124.90” substitute “£128.60;
(ii1) “Disabled child premium” for “£60.90 substitute “£62.86”;
(iv) “Carer premium” for “£34.95” substitute “£36.00”; and
(v) “Enhanced disability premium” for—
(aa) “£24.78” substitute “£25.48”;
(bb) “£15.90” substitute “£16.40”; and
(cc) “£22.85” substitute “£23.55”; and
(b) in paragraph 24 (amount of support component) for “£36.55” substitute “£37.65”.

10. In schedule 2 (amount of alternative maximum council tax reduction), in the table in
paragraph 1(6)—

(a) in entry (b)(i) for “£196.00” substitute “£200.00”; and
(b) in entry (b)(ii) for—

(1) “£196.00” substitute “£200.00”; and

(i1) “£255.00” substitute “£261.00”.

(5) Schedule 1 is relevantly amended by S.S.I. 2013/48, S.S.1. 2014/35, S.S.I. 2015/46 and S.S.1. 2017/41.
(6) The table in paragraph 1 of schedule 2 is amended by S.S.I. 2013/48, S.S.1. 2014/35, S.S.1. 2015/46, S.S.I. 2016/81 and S.S.1.
2017/41.
3


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/48
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2014/35
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2015/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/41
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/48
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2014/35
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2015/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/81
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/41
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/41

