
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 41

The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2017

PART 3
Amendment of the Council Tax Reduction (State

Pension Credit) (Scotland) Regulations 2012

Amendment of schedule 1

18. In schedule 1 (applicable amount)—
(a) in paragraph 2 (personal allowances)—

(i) for “£155.60”, substitute “£159.35”;
(ii) for “£168.70”, substitute “£172.55”;

(iii) for “£237.55” in both places where it occurs, substitute “£243.25”;
(iv) for “£252.30” in both places where it occurs, substitute “£258.15”;
(v) for “£81.95”, substitute “£83.90”; and

(vi) for “£83.60”, substitute “£85.60”; and
(b) in paragraph 13 (amount of disability premium)—

(i) for “£61.85” in both places where it occurs, substitute “£62.45”;
(ii) for “£123.70”, substitute “£124.90”;

(iii) for “£24.43”, substitute “£24.78”;
(iv) for “£60.06”, substitute “£60.90”; and
(v) for “£34.60”, substitute “£34.95”.


